I Ho Elo Te0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of Iundia

EXTRAORDINARY
A II—EUS 3—3U-WUS (ii)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

TR | YehriyTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 2511] 72 fooett, Se@faar, S 5, 2018/3MWIE 14, 1940
No. 2511] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JULY 5, 2018/ASHADHA 14, 1940

FY 3= fraT Feamor waeg
(FF, Tgwiar i famar wearor fawm)
AR
TE fawett, 5 S@Ts, 2018

AT, 3265(3).—Fa T TLH, AFTH aeq AT, 1955 (1955 FT 10) Fif &<T 3 FET T&d
ARl T TART LT gU, IALH (TR, HTaaaw a1 Wiea) (FFeron) sraer, 1985 1 3fiT Fred F &
o Referfaa smaer F3 8, T —
1. (1) Z9 39T T HIT AT AT (FRTa i, Fraaas a1 ffwra) () S genas e, 2018 2
(2) I TSI H IAH TR T AT F IGT g |
2. IATH (AFTEAH, Fra e A7 (7o) (=) amaer, 1985 (BF THH THE TAT I AR Fgl TAT 8)
T 8 % ITEE (4) F AL TLqH & TAT MHTIad T S #Taa AT STTUsT, i —

T3 AE [ TF ALEI, TH ITET & YA o (o0 ToT= § STTE=aT g7 UHl @Arqes sunre faftgd
FT TR ST FHIY AT &TAH IT TETIAA AT ST o6 T A0aT TRt e 3utier a1 femr a1
STHTOMTS o TH{T 21 (S8 87 & w7 U (5w FY 277 91 e &= g

3. I AR & WE 275 o TAT MHATAET G A FATAT [hAT ST, AT —

“Zavw s w1 Rt afeverr yas 9w Afas goas @9 ad F oErq w0 3a9E Fieer
=TT sfiT wforeqor Heuma AT qas, FeArolt a1 9w § BT ety 3avs gferdt s ymremer #§
&7 ITH FHAT)

3804 G1/2018 (1



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]
4. I AR F @S 299 & IUEE (1) § S, HIAHET, ASMATATE, Has T TALT F&T THA TAETLITAT

o i Ther 7, gaT Bem wawn, e ${Y AT S ((AEseers) @ 9 et i
TqF” 9Teal o FITH IT “TeIF” 9e8 TGT STUATT |

5. I AR & @€ 299 H, ITEE (2) F wATq MHforiad sude siq:enta far s, st —

“(3) TRty swEe 32(%F) § FumfafAfas adfier wrfderrdt a7 feee, swee (2) % stefir erfier e g 7w
2 47 JoT TE T T @FEU0 F T 59, FAasr,  as, TMeEEE a1 SaE 7o G age
T 7 AT

6. IF A< F & 30 H,—

(F) SUES (1) ¥ “7 f2A” o ¥ 9re & T 9 i F19 feae” ores T ST,

(@) ITEE (2) F T X MATEd IT@E T@T S0, AAq—

“(2) wanTerTerT, <6 Amae # AfAfde wfgwr = samrener § qym B iy fr e @ awg e ¥ oftaw
T FT Fuor FE0 &7 =T o # FEue RO suiuag w0 ST Fwas 3a<h, ararsaid aT dare
qeeied @il 39 & T8 & AT 7 i fae % oftaw w1 31, 22, 37 33 § 9 s w37

(1) ITET (3) ® “15f7” o 3 s & TITH 9 “ATq fo” ores T ST

7. I AR F BT 32 H, ITEE (2) F THATQ AT STEE ST [T SO, AT —

“(3) STET (2) ¥ [MfEE wartermer & yra [urtas g fdre, Tgat Tamemer g = qa o T8 &
frare =1 srfasria el 3w 3= sifam JreT ST

T 3 AT § STl YA T AT ATl § Tget gy Rre s [t Sraeer R a9 7 97 e
FIfod o Strar g =, Furteuta, ggar fFgwor qur Aot @goer £ &g e § aga saw g, agt
g =rtcs TS T % " 92 o v fageer 3 foro srafera gt fRortees fEgroor f fare & arfa @ i
fomr % oo de g = foro s i srdier % TR |

(4) T =t Tershe T qAaTe A US FFE TG 0 A9 F 09T g 299 F 3uEs (3) F oA
e sEmTereT it B & forg e FAT 99 qo6

(5) sTEe (4) ® [AfEe dov f@gwr w1 oty ager Rgor qur [Forrres &g fare s sifesrra wam sie
| AT STUA |

8. Ih AR % BT 32F H, ITEE (2) F THT MATAEd TGS A FATAT AT STUIT, FAT|—

“(3) THuTT=a SRTereT & aTH Afee fogor &t R gget Sarmem«r T seqa g 9 it afesma
FIT 3T IH AW qTAT ATTAT:

T 39 WIS H gl A A AT et # gget frawr fae siw Fortess fraor foae =t 7 7 3w
Ffd B Srar g ar gty g g gur [ertas @ger £ @guer fae & aga sav g, a=t
=t =fh UF WA % HEr 97 S UE e % forw srtera gt ot S i Rede i arde & 9
fam % sfiaw frae g 3 foro srher sfererrd v erfier =52 @9 |

(4) T YT SATIT THT FT TS F1 UH FTEL TG 60 S 6 THT @€ 299 & ITE@E (3) %
srefie FafAfds yamrermar % e 3 form ey AT 997 99T |




[9rt II-@ve 3(ii) ] HRA hT ASIA : STHIHRO 3

(5) 3UET (4) § [Mf<e dra< fFrgwor w1 g ager fEreperr go Aot REraoor fRare wr afasria w9 6%
I /AT ST |

9. ITH AT T STLAT 1 AT (F) §,—
(F) G&| qI9F qeat F gaterd oftds 1(2) §, 77 dedqis 22 =7 396 getdag vty & gvarq Futatea w4
HEATH ST T TETT ST T I STUIM, FATq| —
“23 A TUFATHATSA
(i) AT F AT 9 Ifaerd a4+ (B F &7 H),

A 10.0
@iy  PH 8.5+1
(i) fafors e 1.3-1.4
(iv) 9T % YT 92 =9 (Pb % &9 ®, srfarmdw) 0.003
(v) T % AT 9T qidera Afeam 0.01
(Vi)  9TT % YT 9 As o &9 § ATahan 0.0025™;

(@) wIfcHIEe A<t | dataa uefivs 1(;) § F7 d&di® 25 3T SHe "ataq JEiedr & 747q
erferfa s dweaie e wfateat smaenfia fir s, satg —

“26. STEQT SAFATSE % AT G&EH &1 & FT H FIEhHISE qTicas e

() 9TT % YTT 9T Tidera qrfeash e 67.0
S & &7 H, =AqH

(i) 9T % e u¥ giAed ST, Zn % €9 H, gAaH 14.0
(iii) ATT % 3T 9T widera 79, srfereaw 2.6

(iv) F9T T AT 0.149 HHTAETH FAAT T2 ATHUT FHT 80% AT T

10.  IF TG T AGHHAT 2 F W & & 937 4% H, HF (jii) F TETq MEeied 78 sq e S S,
AT —

18

“(iv)  100% ST & Feaefte 39 3T 100% ST | qoAaefier 3aa F7 fsor 100 IT.”;

11, I AR AT ATLAT 4 F AN F § /¥ G&IiF 7 3 I FgaArq WAt F g Fatortaa w0 geais
ST Sttt s eamiaa it STuaf, s —

“8 TETHISCH § AT TIET
() 9T % smweme uw ot afaer, srferemaw 5.0
(i) AT &R ST | AT qreTer, FAad 20.0

(iii) 9T % AT T FA T&F (S F T H), FAqH 1.5



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

(iv) ATLY & fer (7. am./f36. 9T, & =9 ) srfeemaw

wfer (As203) 10.
ESERES (Cd ¥ =7 ) 5.0
EalERE (Cr ¥ =7 &) 50.0
SIEl (Cu ¥ =7 &) 300.00
T (Hg 3 = ) 0.1
IRE] (Ni ¥ =7 %) 50.00
=T (Pb ¥ =7 ) 100.00
STt (Zn 3 =7 ) 1000.00”

12, ITH AL T AGGAT V F G0 F H, HF G&>iF 1 A7 I99 qateq graredt & e o Aaterted 59
Tt ST wiateat vt Jrost, sraiq—

ST Ao T welt i "remor Aforfeat

FHH, | TASh faforfeart

1. T o ST 9T T4 AThaA 10.0

2. AT o ST 9T T ATTHAH 15.0

3. PH 453 6.5

4. FTAFRAT <40

3. WY % LT 9T F AT (%) ~IAqH 1.5

6. TqTE 3 AT 9T FA Po0s TTA9r, 7aq 0.20

7. T o ST 9T 9T F qrerer K,0 widera | 0.50
A"

8. Y & AL T I F FAd9 Had I09qd | 23.0”
AaH

13. ITF AR F T&T T F “TH. /AT TH.E” oreat F T 97 S U Ao St o A ores T ST
[®T.H, 2-3/2018-39%F fatd]

=T srdtaw, g6 @t
grg feoqur,  gor smRer, W@ F o, § sfeeEeT " 91,758 arfte 25 fBdew, 1985 3w

TRTTO FoFT 10 o i r.sm s 1323(3) arg 22 914, 2018 g sifaw Hemerer T
T



[T I-88 3(ii)] YRA T TSTIA : STHIERYT 5
MINISTRY OF AGRICULTURE AND FARMERS WELFARE
(Department of Agriculture, Cooperation and Farmers Welfare)
ORDER
New Delhi, the 5th July, 2018

S.0. 3265(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Essential Commodities Act,
1955 (10 of 1955), the Central Government hereby makes the following Order further to amend the Fertiliser
(Inorganic, Organic or Mixed) (Control) Order, 1985, namely:-

1. (1) This Order may be called the Fertiliser (Inorganic, Organic or Mixed) (Control) Third Amendment
Order, 2018.

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Fertiliser (Inorganic, Organic or Mixed) (Control) Order, 1985, (hereinafter referred to as said
Order), in clause 8, in sub-clause (4), after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:—

“Provided that a State Government may, by notification in Official Gazettee, specify such bachelor
degree equivalent to the Bachelor of Science in agriculture or Bachelor of Science in chemistry or
any other degree or diploma or certificate having at least one of the subjects as agriculture input or
chemistry for the purpose of this sub-clause.”.

3. After clause 27 A of the said Order, the following clause shall be inserted, namely,—

“27 AA. Regular training of Fertiliser Inspectors.- Every Fertiliser Inspector shall undergo training
after every three years in the Central Fertiliser Quality Control and Training Institute or any
Regional Fertiliser Quality Control Laboratory at Mumbai, Kalyani or Chennai.” .

4. In clause 29 B, of the said Order, in sub-clause (1), for the words “National Test House at Chennai,
Kolkatta, Ghaziabad, Mumbai and Jaipur, soil testing laboratory, Soil Science Division, Indian Agricultural
Research Institute (IARI), PUSA, New Delhi and every”, the word “Every” shall be substituted.

5. In clause 29B of the said Order, after sub-clause (2), the following sub-clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(3) The Appellate authority as specified in sub-clause 32 A or the Controller, as the case may be,
shall on receipt of an appeal under sub-clause (2) decide and send the third sample for analysis to any
of the National Test House Laboratories at Chennai, Kolkatta, Mumbai, Ghaziabad or Jaipur.”.

6. In clause 30 of the said order,-
(a) in sub-clause (1), for the words “seven days”, the words “three working days” shall be substituted;
(b) for sub-clause (2), the following sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) The laboratory shall analyse the sample and forward the analysis report in Form L within fifteen
days, and in case of the sample of organic fertiliser, biofertiliser and non-edible de-oiled cake
fertilisers, in Form L1, L2 and L3, respectively, within thirty days, from the date of receipt of the
sample in the laboratory to the authority specified in the said memorandum.”.

(c) in sub-clause (3), for the words “15 days” , the words “ seven days” shall be substituted.
7. In clause 32 of the said Order, after sub-clause (2), the following sub-clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) The referee analysis report received from the laboratory referred to in sub-clause (2) shall
supersede the analysis report submitted by first laboratory and shall be treated as final;.

Provided that in case where the sample is declared as non-standard both in the first analysis report and
referee analysis report but in different parameters or there is wide variation in the analysis report of
first analysis and referee analysis, as the case may be, the aggrieved person may appeal to the
controller for third analysis within thirty days from the date of receipt of the report of referee analysis
on payment of such charges as may be required for such analysis.



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

4. The Controller after providing an opportunity to the aggrieved party of being heard may send the
third sample for analysis to the Laboratory and specified under sub-clause (3) of clause 29 B.

5. The result of the third analysis referred to in sub-clause (4) shall supersede the first analysis and
referee analysis report and shall be treated as final.”.

8. In clause 32 A of the said Order, after sub-clause (2), the following sub-clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(3) The report of reference analysis received from referee laboratory shall supersede the analysis
report submitted first laboratory and shall be treated as final:

Provided that in case where the sample is declared as non-standard both in the first analysis report and
referee analysis report but in different parameters or there is wide variation in the analysis report of first
analysis and referee analysis , as the case may be, the aggrieved person may appeal to the appellate
authority for third analysis within thirty days from the date of receipt of the report of referee analysis on
payment of such charges as may be required for such analysis.

(4) The appellate authority after providing an opportunity to the aggrieved party of being heard may send the
third sample for analysis to the laboratory specified under sub-clause (3) of clause 29 B.

5. The result of the third analysis referred to in sub-clause (4) shall supersede the report of first analysis and
referee analysis and shall be treated as final.

9. In Schedule I to the said Order, in Part A,—

(a) in sub-heading 1 (g), relating to Micronutrients, after serial number 22 and entries relating thereto, the
following serial number and entries shall be inserted, namely:-

“23. Boron ethanolamine

(i) Boron ( as B), per cent. by weight, minimum 10.0

(i) pH 8.5+1
(iii) Specific gravity 1.3-14
(iv) Lead (as Pb) per cent by weight maximum 0.003
(v) Arsenic (as As) per cent by weight, maximum 0.01

(vi) Cadmium (as Cd) per cent by weight, maximum 0.00257;

( b) in sub-heading 1 (h), relating to Fortified fertilisers, after serial number 25 and entries relating thereto,
the following serial number and entries shall be inserted, namely:-

“26.  Elemental Sulphur fortified with Zinc Oxide in microgranule form

(i) FElemental Sulphur as S per cent by weight, minimum : 67.0
(i) Zinc as Zn per cent by weight, minimum : 14.0
(iii) Moisture, per cent by weight, maximum : 2.0

(iv) Particle size: 80%of the material shall retain on 0.149 mm IS sieve”.

10. In Schedule II to the paid Order, in Part A, in paragraph 4 A, after item (iii), the following item shall be
inserted, namely:-

“(iv) For 100 % Water Soluble fertiliser and 100% water soluble Mixture of fertiliser 100g.”;

11.in Schedule IV to the said Order, in Part A, after serial number 7 and entries relating thereto, the
following serial number and entries shall be inserted, namely:-

“8. Potash derived from Rhodophytes
(i) Moisture per cent by weight , maximum 5.0
(ii) Water soluble Potash, per cent. by weight minimum 20.0
(iii) Total Sulphur (as S) , per cent. by weight minimum 1.5



[ H—@ve 3(ii) ] AR <pl TSTUA « SAHIHRIT 7

(iv) Heavy metal content (as mg/kg), maximum

Arsenic as (As,03) 10.0
Cadmium (as Cd) 5.0
Chromium (as Cr) 50.0
Copper (as Cu) 300.00
Mercury (as Hg) 0.15
Nickel (as Ni) 50.00
Lead (as Pb) 100.00
Zinc (as Zn) 1000.00”.

12. In Schedule V to the said Order, in Part A, for serial number 1 and entries relating thereto the following
serial number and entries shall be substituted, namely,-

“1. General specifications of Non-Edible De-Oiled Cake

Sl. No. | Components Specification
1. Moisture per cent. by weight maximum 10.0
2. Ash Content per cent. by weight maximum 15.0
3. pH 4.5t06.5
4. Conductivity <4.0
5. Total Nitrogen per cent. by weight, minimum 1.5
6. Total Phosphate P,Os per cent. by weight, minimum 0.20
7. Total Potash K,O per cent. by weight minimum 0.50
8. Total Carbon per cent. minimum by weight minimum 23.0".

13. In Form M to the said Order, for the words “ST/ CST”, the words “ GST/SGST” shall be substituted.

[F.No. 2-3/2018 Fert Law]
NEERAJA ADIDAM, Jt. Secy.
Note: The principal Order was published in the Gazette of India, vide notification number G.S.R. 758 (E),

dated the 25th September, 1985 and last amended vide number S.O. 1323 (E) dated the 22nd March,
2018.

Digitally signed by
RAKESH RAKESH SUKUL

Date: 2018.07.09
SU KU L 22:45:31 +05'30'

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



		2018-07-09T22:45:31+0530
	RAKESH SUKUL




