
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÚxÉ 7, 2018/VªÉä¹`ö 17, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XL OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the President in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 7th June 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Indian Penal Code, 1860 and the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973, in their application to the State of

Maharashtra.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Indian Penal Code, 1860
and the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, in their application to the State
of Maharashtra, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted
in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India, as follows :—

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY.

1. This Act may be called the Indian Penal Code and the Code of
Criminal Procedure (Maharashtra Amendment) Act, 2017.

45 of
1860.

2 of
1974.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEò 41] MÉȪ ûý´ÉÉ®úú, VÉÚxÉ 7, 2018/VªÉä¹`ö 17, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 82

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Indian Penal Code and Code of Criminal Procedure (Maharashtra Amendment)
Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No. XL of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

Short title.

(1)

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--82-------1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÚxÉ 7, 2018/VªÉä¹`ö 17, ¶ÉEäò 19402

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE INDIAN PENAL CODE, 1860.

2. In section 332 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860, in its application to
the State of Maharashtra (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the
said Code”), for the words “ three years” the words “ five years” shall be
substituted.

3. In section 353 of the said Code, for the words “ two years” the
words “ five years ” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS TO THE CODE OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE, 1973.

4. In section 309 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, in its
application to the State of Maharashtra (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “ the Code of Criminal Procedure”), after the existing proviso,
the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“ Provided further that, when the enquiry or trial relates to an
offence under section 332 or 353 of the Indian Penal Code, the inquiry
or trial shall, as far as possible be completed within a period of six
months from the date of filing of the charge sheet.”.

5. In the First Schedule to the Code of Criminal Procedure, under
the heading “I.-OFFENCES UNDER THE INDIAN PENAL CODE”,—

(i) for the entry relating to section 332, the following entry shall
be substituted, namely :—

“332 Voluntary Imprison- Cognizable Non- Court of
causing ment bailable Session.”;
hurt to for five
deter years, or
public fine, or
servant both.
from his
duty.

(ii) for the entry relating to section 353, the following entry shall
be substituted, namely :—

“353 Assault Imprison- Cognizable Non- Court of
or use of ment bailable Session.”.
criminal for five
force to years, or
deter a fine, or
public both.
servant
from
discharge of
his duty.

Amendment
of section 332
of 45 of 1860.

45 of
1860.

Amendment
of section 353
of 45 of 1860.

45 of
1860.

Amendment
of section 309

of 2 of 1974.

Amendment
of First

Schedule  of
2 of 1974.

2 of
1974.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR
SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI
ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.


