RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

Reg. No. MH/MR/ South 344/2011-13

ad ¥, 3w (¥)] v, At ¥, 20%R/5m@T ¢3, T RR3¥ [48 «, fwa : vad 2¢.00

FAETIRUT HHTE ¥E
| ; .
Rt frurnizee afufaw @ U senfua FEe sy @ Few fafem eaf
faeft & wmw fawrmega aeet fadad (TSl erEE)
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation

in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Municipal Councils (Amendment) Act,
2012 (Mah. Act No. XVII of 2012), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By Qrc'ier and in the name of the Governor of Maharashira,

' H. B. PATEL,
Secretary to Government,
Law and.Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XVII OF 2012.

(First pubh‘shed,- after having received the assent of the Governgr, in the
"Maharashtra Government Gazette", on the 4th August 2012).

[ An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City of
Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

B}m{bég WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
0 .

Bom. LIX Corporation Act, the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act,
é’_fpllgﬁd 1949, the City of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 and the Maharashtra

Berar II

of 1650. Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965,

Mah. XL
of 1965.

AT E—¥E-Q o



Short title.

Amendment

HERTE WG (OO SRR {306, HTE ¥, 08/ HE R3, W 3%

for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows:—:

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY.

1.-This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations

and Municipal Councils (Amendment) Act, 2012.

CHAPTER 1I

' _ AMENDMENTS TO THE MumeAl MUNICIPAL
CoORPORATION ACT.

. 2. In section 50S of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act (hereinafter

of section in this Chapter referred to as “the Mumbai Corporation Act”), in
508 of sub-section (2), for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be
Bom. III of gypstituted, namely:—

1888

Amendment

“Provided that, the relative strength of the recognized parties
or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front shall be calculated
by first dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee. The number of Councillors of the
recognized parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front
shall be further divided by the quotient of this division. The figures
so arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front. The
seats shall be allotted to the recognized parties or registered parties
or groups or aghadi or front by first considering the whole number
of their respective relative strength so ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manner, if one or more seats remain to be
allotted, the same shall be allotted one each to the recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front in the
descending order of the fraction number in the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relative
strength, till all the seats are allotted:”. :

3. In section 129A of the Mumbai Corporation Act, after the words

~ of section and figures “under section 125” the words, figures and letter “and

129A of

Bo estimates prepared by the General Manager under section 126A” shall
m. [II of s
1888, be inserted.

Amendment

of section @2

460A of
Bom. III of
1888.

4. In section 460A of the Mumbai Corporation Act, after sub-section
), the following sub-section shall be added, namely :—

“(3) Where, any proposél of the General Manager requires the -

sanction or approval of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and
Transport Committee or the corporation, the Brihan Mumbai Electric
Supply and Transport Committee or, as the case may be, the
corporation,. shall consider and dispose of any such proposal within
forty-five days in case of the said Committee and ninety days in
case of the corporation, reckoned from the date of the meeting
of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and Transport Committee

Bom.
III of
1888.



WEWTE WG TS0 TR0 WOT 31, AT ¥, 0%/ A@ 23, Wk ]3¥

or, as the case may be, the corporation, held immediately after
the proposal is received by the Secretary of the said Committee
or as the case may be, the Municipal Secretary, whether the item
pertaining to such proposal is taken on agenda of such meeting
or not, failing which, sanction or approval to such proposal shall
be deemed to have been given by the Brihan Mumbai Electric
Supply and Transport Committee or, as the case may be, the
corporation, and a report to that effect shall be made by the General
Manager to the Government and it shall be lawful for the General
Manager to take further action as per the directives of the Government :

Provided that, any such deemed sanction or approval shall be
restricted to the extent the proposal conforms to the provisions
of this Act or any other law for the time being in force.”.
5. In section 460K of the Mumbai Corporation Act,—

(1) in clause (c), for the words “ten lakhs rupees” the words
“fifty lakhs rupees” shall be substituted ; :

(2) in clause (d), for the words “one lakh rupees” the words
“five lakhs rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In section 460L of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in the proviso,

after the words “ Transport Committee” the words “or by two officers

of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and Transport Undertaking to

whom the powers have been delegated by the General Manager” shall
be added.

7. In section 460M of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section

(1)~

(1) for the words “fifty thousand rupees” the words “three lakhs
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(2) the following proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that, the notice of any tender for contract not
exceeding three lakhs rupees shall be uploaded on the official
website of the Brihan Mumbai Electric Supply and Transport
Undertaking.”.

8. In section 460Q of the Mumbai Corporation Act,—

(1) in clause (a), for the words “two thousand rupees”
“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(2) in clause (b), in the proviso, for the words “fifteen thousand
rupees ” the words “ seventy-five thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(8) in clause (¢),—

(i) for the words “one lakh rupees” at the both places where
they occur, the words “five lakhs rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “ for any period ” the words “ for any continuous
period” shall be substituted ;

(iii) for the words “ ten thousand rupees ” the words “fifty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

1

the words

T AS—¥E-R

Amendment
of section
460K of
Bom. III of
1888.

Amendment
of section
460L of
Bom. III of
1888.

Amendment
of section
460M of
Bom. III of
1888.

Amendment
of section
460Q of
Bom. III of
1888.



¥ HERTE VT TAYH HEURYT WIT A1S, AW ¥, 0%/ AE {3, T []3I¥

Amendment 9, In section 460R of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section

of section (9) in the proviso, for the words “four hundred rupees” the words
460R of 5 .
Bom. III of ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

1888. : -
Amendment 10. In' section 460T of the Mumbai Corporation Act,—

of section

460T of (1) in sub-section (I), for the words “four hundred rupees” the
Bom. Illéggf words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

_.'(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “four hundred rupees” the
words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

; CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE BomBAY ProvinciaL MuNnicipaAL
CORPORATIONS AcT, 1949.

Amendment 11. In section 31A of the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations
of gel'im; Act, 1949, in sub-section (2), for the first proviso, the following proviso
Bom. Lix shall be substituted, namely:—

_of 1949.

“Provided that, the relative strength of the recognized parties
or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front shall be calculated
by first dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee. The number of Councillors of the
recognized parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front
shall be further divided by the quotient of this division. The figures
so arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front. The
seats shall be allotted to the recognized parties or registered parties
or groups or aghadi or front by first considering the whole number
of their respective relative strength so ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manner, if one or more seats remain to be
allotted, the same shall be allotted one each to the recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front in the
descending order of the fraction number in the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relatwe
strength, till all the seats are allotted:”

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENT TO THE CITY OF NAGPUR CORPORATION AcT, 1948.

Amendment  12. In section 40A of the City of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948,
of section jn gyb-section (2), for the first proviso, the following proviso shall
40A of C.P. 2
and Berar D€ substituted, mamely:—

Tl 1200 “Provided that, the relative strength of the recognized parties

or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front shall be calculated
by first dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee. The number of Councillors of the
recognized parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front
shall be further divided by the quotient of this division. The figures

Bom.
LIX of
1949,

C.P.and
Berar 11
of 1950.



HERTE, VITRA TSI STHTIRUT MIT 318, AT ¥, [0%3/H@0T {3, Wah ]I

so arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front. The
seats shall be allotted to the recognized parties or registered parties
or groups or aghadi or front by first considering the. whole number
of their respective relative strength so ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manner, if one or more seats remain to be
allotted, the same shall be allotted one each to the recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front in the
descending order of the fraction number in the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relative
strength, till all the seats are allotted.”.

CHAPTER V

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MuNICIPAL CoOUNCILS, NAGAR
Pancravars AnD InpustriaL Townsaips Acrt, 1965.

Mah. 13, In section 63 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Amendment
XL of pgnchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (2B), of section

1965 for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:- ?{iff nggs

“Provided that, the relative strength of the recognized parties
or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front shall be calculated
by first dividing the total number of Councillors by the total strength
of members of the Committee. The number of Councillors of the
recognized parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front
shall be further divided by the quotient of this division. The figures
so arrived at shall be the relative strength of the respective recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front. The
seats shall be allotted to the recognized parties or registered parties
or groups or aghadi or front by first considering the whole number
of their respective relative strength so ascertained. After allotting
the seats in this manner, if one or more seats remain to be
allotted, the same shall be allotted one each to the recognized
parties or registered parties or groups or aghadi or front in the
descending order of the fraction number in the respective relative
strength starting from the highest fraction number in the relative
strength, till all the seats are allotted:”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH
GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAIL 400 004 AND PUBLISHED
AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI
400 004, EDITOR - SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVL



