
RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528
Reg No..MHlMRlSouth-344/2011-2013

~~

~~~
~ <qJ1T311'0

eN ~. 3tq; ~~] ~. ~ ~ ~o~~/~ m ~~~~ [ Tt ~ ~ : ~ ~(..oo

3i~I~I(UI ~ ~G

~~

~ ~11-1>i$ct;I..,) ~ Of (1""'4IMj..f\ \'!(gC.Ilr4t1~ ~ Of ~ ~
3TTfVT fufU Of ~ ~1'1Iq,~-1 ~ ~ (~ ~).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the 'Constitution of India, the following
translation in English ofthe Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment and Validation)
Act, 2012 (Mah. Act No. VIII of 2012), is hereby published under the authority of the
Governor.

By order and in the name of the Goyernor of Maharashtra,

H. B. PATEL,
Secretary to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRAACT No. VIIIOF 2012.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the" Maharashtra Government Gazette ", on the 25th April 20 12.)

An Act further to amend certain tax laws in operation in the State of
Maharashtra.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend certain tax laws;in
operation in the State of Maharashtra, for the purposes hereinafter
appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-third Year ofthe Republic
of India as follows :-

. CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Short title
Amendment and Validation) Act, 2012. andcommence-

ment.
"mT.~ ~-., (~)



~ ~ ~ ~ di~It.lI<UI 'q11f atTO. .~!a.. ~O~~/~ !a.. m ~~~)!

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act.-

(a) sections 3 to 6. sub-section (2) of section 7, sections 8 to 11.
sub-sections (2) and (3) of section 12, sections 13 and 14, section 17,
sub-section (3) of section 18, section 19, sub-section (2) of section 20,
sections 21 and 22, sections 24 and 25, sub-section (1) of section 26,
sections 21 to 30 and section 32 shall come into force with effect.

,from'the IstMay-2012;

; . (b) sub-section (1) of section 7, sub-section (1) of section 20, section
. 23, sub~s~ction (2) of section 26 shall come into force from such date
.. as the State Governmenfmay by notification in the Official Gazette,

. j appoint, and different dates'may be appointed-for different sections.

Amendment
of

SCHEDULE
I appended

- to Born. LX
of 1958.

CHAPTER II

A'\1El\,'DMEJl.'TS TO THE BOMBAY STAMP ACT, 1958.

2. In SCHEDULE I appended to the Bombay Stamp Act, 1958,- Born.
LX of

(a) in article 5, in clause (g-a),in column 2, for the brackets, letters 1958.
and word ", (c) or (d)" at both the places where they occur, the word,
brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(b) in article 16, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" the word, brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(c) in article 25,- .

(i) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :-

. -
"(b) if relating to immovable property situated,-

(i) within the limits of any Municipal
Corporation or any Cantonment area
annexed to it or any urban area not
mentioned in sub-clause (ii).

. (ii) within the. limits of any Municipal
Council or Nagar Panchayat or
Cantonment area annexed to it, or
any rural area within the limits of the
Mumbai Metropolitan Region Development
Authority, or the Influence Areas as per
the annual statement of rates published
under the Bombay Stamp (Determination
of True Market Value of Property)
Rules, 1995.

(iii) within the limits of any Grampanchayat
area or any such area not mentioned in
sub-clause (ii).

(ii) clause (d) shalt be deleted;

(iii) the existing Explanation II shall be deleted;

5 per cent. of the
market value of
the property.

4 per cent. of the
market value of

the property.

3 per cent. of the
market value of
the property.";



~'~~ ~<t1I~I~UI 'IWT 31lO, ~ ~~, ~o~~/~~, ~.~~~)f ~

(d) in article 32, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" the word, brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(e) in article 33, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" at both the places where they occur, the word, brackets
and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(f> in article 34, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" the word, brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(g) in article 36, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" wherever they occur, the word, brackets -and letter
"or (c)" shall be substituted;

(h) in article 40, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" the word, brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(i) in article 47, in column ~ for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" at both the places where they occur, the word, brackets
and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(j) in article 48, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" wherever they occur, the word, brackets and letter
"or (c)" shall be substituted; .

(k) in article 52, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and words
", (c) or (d), as the case may. be" the words, brackets and letter
"or as the case may be (c)" shall be substitut~(:L

(1) in article 55, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" at both the places where they occur, the word, brackets
and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(m) in article 58, iIi column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" the word, brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(n) in article 60, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" the word, brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted;

(0) in article 61, in column 2, for the brackets, letters and word
", (c) or (d)" the word, brackets and letter "or (c)" shall be substituted.

CHAPTER lIT

AMKNDMENTS TO THE BOMBAY MOTOR VEHICLES TAX ACT, 1958.

Born.
LXV

of
1958.

3. In the THIRD SCHEDULE to the Bombay Motor Vehicles Tax Amendment

Act, 1958, in PART I, in column (2), for clauses (a), (b) and (c), the! ~~iii~&E
following shall be substituted, namely :- . of Born.

"(1) Petrol driven vehicles. ;i LXV of. . . 1958.
(a) 9 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, if the cost of the vehicle is

uptoRs. 10 lakhs ; .. .
(b) 10 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, if the cost of the vehicle

exceeds Rs.10 lakhs but does not exceed Rs. 20 lakhs ; .

(c) 11 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, if the cost of vehicle exceeds
Rs. 20 lakhs ;

'IWT3110- ~<..-~-3i



'6

Amendment
of section

12B of Mah.
IX of 1962.

Amendment
of section 2

of Mah. XVI
of 1975.

Amendment
of section 3

of Mah. XVI
of 1975.

~ mwr ~ ~ 'I1flTarlO, ~ ~t.."~o~~/~ t.."m ~~i!~ .

(2) Diesel driven vehicles:

(a) 11 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, ifthe cost of the vehicle
is upto Rs.IO1akhs; .

(b) 12 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, if the cost of the vehicle
exceeds Rs.lO lakhs but does not exceed Rs.20 lakhs;

(c) 13 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, ifthe cost of the vehicle
exceeds Rs.20 lakhs;

. . (3) Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) driven new vehicle with
, original equipment fitted with CNG Kit by manufacturer:

(a) 5 per cent. ofthe cost of vehicle, if the cost ofthe vehicle is
upto Rs. 10 lakhs;

(b) 6 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, ifthe cost of the vehicle
exceeds Rs.10 lakhs but does not exceed Rs. 20 lakhs;

(c) 7 per cent. of the cost of vehicle, if the cost of the vehicle
exceeds Rs.20 lakhs.". ..

CHAPTER IV

AMENDME~'TSTO THE MAHARAsHTRAPURCHASE TAX ON SUGARCA.'\'EACT, 1962.

4. In section 12B of the Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Mah.
Act 1962 - IX of

, , 1962.
(1) in clause (b), for the word "and" the word "or" shall be

substituted;

(2) in clause (c), for the words "a factory" the words "a factory;
or" shall be substituted;

(3) after clause {c), the following clause shall be added, namely: -

"(d) for the purpose of establishing a co-generation unit for
generation of electricity from the products or by-products of the

said fac~ory.".

CHAPTER V

A'VIENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA STATE TAX ON PROFESSIONS, TRADES,

CALLINGS A'\'D EMPLOYME~'TS ACT, 1975.

5. In section 2 of the Maharashtra State Tax on Professions, Trades, Mah.
Callings and Employments Act, 1975 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, XVI

referred to as "the Profession Tax Act"), in clause (a), after the words ~~75.
"and includes" the words "the Special Commissioner of Profession Tax
and" shall be inserted.

6. In section 3 of the Profession Tax Act, in sub-section (2), after
the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :-

"Provided also that, a person who is liable to pay tax has remained
un-enrolled; then, his liability to pay tax under this section for the
periods for which he has remained so un-enrolled shall not exceed
eight years from the end of tl1e year immediately preceding the year



~ mw:r ~ ~~I~I<UImrr 3fIQ,.~to., ~o~~/~~, ~ ~'r~~

in which he has obtained the enrollment certificate or the year in
which the proceeding for enrollment is .initiated against him,
whichever is earlier.".

to.

Amendment
of section 6

shall be of Mah. XVI
of 1975.

7. in section 6 of the Profession Tax Act,-

(1) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section
substituted, namely :- .

"(3) Where an employer has failed to file such. return within
the prescribed time, he shall pay, by way of a late fee, an amount
of rupees one thousand before filing of the said return. This
amount shall be in addition to the amount payable, if any, as per
the return.";

(2) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be added,
namely :-

"(4) Any employer liable to file return, having furnished a
return,-

(a) discovers any omission or incorrect statement therein,
may furnish, a revised return in respect of the period covered
by the return, at any time before a notice for .assessment is
served Onhim in respect of the period covered by the said return
or before the expiry of a period of six months from the end of
the year to which such return relates, whichever is earlier;

(b) agrees with the findings conjained in any intimation
received by him as a result of,-

(i) audit under section 7A; or,

(ii) inspection under section 18,

then he may furnish a revised return as per the findings of audit or,
as the case may be, inspection within thirty days from the date of
receipt of such intimation.".

8. In section 12 of the Profession Tax Act, in sub-section (1),-:-
(1) in clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), for the words "one or more

officers" the words "a Special Commissioner of Profession Tax and
one or more officers" shall be substituted;

(2) ill clause (b), for the words "Additional Commissioners" the
words" Special Commissioner, Additional Commissioners" shall be
substituted.

Amendment
of section
12 of Mah.
XVI of
1975.

9. In section19 of the Profession Tax Act, for the word "person", Amen~ment
wherever it occurs, the words "employer or person" ~hall be substitl1;ted. ~~~~~~~~~

CHAPTER VI . :. of 1975.

A\fElI,'DME.'\'TSTo THE MAIiARAsHTRA TAX ON LUXURIES'AcT, 1987.

Mah. 10. In section 2 of the Mahaiashtra Tax ohLuxuriesAct',,;'i987

~~ (hereinafter; in this Chapter, referr~d to as "the Luxury Tax Act'\ in
1987. clause (c), after the words "and Includes" the words "a SpecIal

Commissioner of Luxury Tax and" shall be inserted.

Amendment
of section 2
of Mah. XLI
of 1987.



G ~ mwr ~ "I~,t.I,~u, \WT 3TTO,.~\o" ~o~~~ \0" ~ ~~~'jf

Amendment 11. In section 7 of the Luxury Tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause

of s~ct~~ (b), in sub-clause (i), for the words "one or more officers" the words
XLIoofi987: "the Special Commissioner of Luxury Tax and one or, more officers"

shall be substituted.

CHAPTER VII

ANIENDm;?\'TS To THE MAHARAsHTRA TAX ON E?\'TRY OF MOTOR VEHICLES ,

I?\'TOLoCALAREASACT, 1987.

Amendment i~. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Tax on Entry of Motor Vehicles Mah.

of se~t~~2 into Local Areas Act, 1987 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as Xfn
°xiIIof "the Entry TaxAct"), in sub-section (1),- ~987.

1987, I (1) in clause (b), for the words and figure "under section 6" the
words and figure "under section 5" shall be substituted and shall be
deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st April 2006;

(2) in clause (f), for the words "for use or sale therein" the words
" for use, consumption or, as the case may be, sale therein" shall be
substituted;

(3) in clause (g), for the words" for use or sale therein" the words
" for use, consumption or, as the case may be, sale therein" shall be
substituted.

Amendment 13. In section 3 ofthe Entry Tax Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
of section 3 of "for use or sale therein" the words "for use consum ption or as theMah XLII "

. of"1987. case may be, sale therein" shall be substituted.

Insertion of 14. After section 7 of the Entry Tax Act, the following section shallsection7Ain b
.

rt d IMah,XLIIof e mse e ,name y:-
1987"

Electronic
filing of

return and
electronic
payment.

"7A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the
Commission.er may, from time to time, by notification in the Official
Gazette, specify the period, shirting on or after the date mentioned
therein and the class or classes of importers,-

(a) who shall submit application, annexure, appeal, return or
such other document as may be required, in an electronic form
with or without digital signature, in the manner specified in the
said notification;

(b) who shall pay tax, interest, penalty or any amount due and
payable by or under this Act electronically in chalan as prescribed
under the rules made in this behalf.

(2) If the Commissioner has issued any notification' under this
section, then. with a view to promote effective compliance and
ensuring compatibility with the automated system, he may provide
for amendments to be made to the forms or may introduce new forms
of returns, applications, annexures or any other document which is
required to be transmitted or submitted electronically.".



Mah. 17. In the SCHEDULE appended to the Maharashtra Tax on the

Iioo~~ Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2002,-
(1) in entry 1,-

(a) in clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), forthe figures
and sign "26%" the words, brackets, figures and letters "As specified
from time to time, against clause (a) of entry 5 of SCHEDULE D
appended to the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002" shall
be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the figures
and sign "23%" the words, brackets, figures and letters "As specified
from time to time, against clause (b) of entry 5 of SCHEDULE D
appended to the Maharashtra Value Added TaX Act, 2002" shall
be substituted;

(2) in entry 2,-

(a) in column (2), for the brackets, words and figure "(other than
that covered by entry ,g)" the words, figure and letter "other than
those covered by entry 2A ofthis SCHEDULE" shall be substituted;

. (b) in column (3), for the figures and sign "25%" the words,
figures and letter "As specified from time to time, against entry 6
ofSCHEDu"LE D appended to the Maharashtra Value Added Tax
Act, 2002" shall be substituted;

Mah.
IX of
2005.

Mah.
IX of
2005.

Mah.
IX of
2005.

.~ mwf ~ ~ ~ 3TTQ,~ ~I...,~o~~/~ 1 m ~~~)!

15. In section 9A of the Entry Tax Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words and figure "under section 6" the words and figure" under section 5"
shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with
effect from the 1st April 2006.

16. In section 13 of the Entry Tax Act, in s~b-section (1), for the
words and figure "under section 6" the words and figure "under section
5" shall ,be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from the 1st April 2006.

CHAPTER VIII

AvrEN'DMENTSTo THE MAHARASHTRATAX ON' THE E!\'TRY OF GoODS INTO

LoCAL AREAS ACT, 2002.

(3) after entry 2, the following entry shall be inserted, namely ;-

Mah.
IX of
2005.

As specified from: 'time to
time, against entry 11 of
SCH~DULE D appended
to the Maharasht,ra Value
Ad~ed Tax Act; 2Q()2.";

"2A. Aviation Turbine Fuel

(Duty paid) when delivered
within the Maharashtra State
excluding the geographical
lin;.its,pU!rjl1!l}} Mumbai
Corporation" and Pune
District.

(4) in entry 3, in column (3), for the figures and sign "30%" the
words, figures and letter "As specified from time to time, against

1.9

Amendment
of section
9A of Mah.
XLII of
1987.

Amendment
of section
13 of Mah.
XLII of
1987.

Amendment
of
SCHEDULE

appended to
Mah. IV of
2003.



C-

Amendment

of section 2
of Mah. IX

of 2005.

. .

~ ~ ~ ~ 'IWT 3110, ~ ~,,-, ~o~~/ctm&:,,-, m ~~~)!

entry 7 of SCHEDULE D appended to the Maharashtra Value Added Mah.

Tax Act, 2002" shall be substituted ; ~~o~f
(5) in entry 4, in column (3), for the figures and sign "10%" the

words, figures and letter "As specified from time to time, against

entry 8 ofSf,;HEDULE Q appended to the Maharashtra Value Added ~hf
Tax Act, 200.2 " shall be substituted; 200~.

- "(6) in entry 5, in column (3), for the figures and sign "24%" the
-words, figures and letter "As specified from time to time, against
'entry 9 ofSCHEDL'LE D appended to the Maharashtra Value Added Mah.
Tax Act 2002" shall be substituted' IX of

I' , 2005.

(7) in entry 6,-

(a) in clause (a), in column (3), for the figures, signs and words
"26% + one rupee per litre" the words, figures and letter "As
specified from time to time, against entry 10 of SCHEDULE D
appended to the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002" shall Mah.
be substituted' IX of

, 2005.
(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the figures, signs and words

"25% + one rupee per iitre" the words, figures and letter "As
specified from time to time, against entry 10 of SCHEDULE D
appended to the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002" shall Mah.
be substituted' IX of

, 2005.
(8) after entry 15, the following entry shall be added, namely :-

"16. Naturalgas.. 12.5%.".

CHAPTER IX

A'VIE~D:\1E~TS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VALUE ADDED TAX ACT, 2002.

18. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002 Mah.

(hereinafter; in this Chapter, referred to as "the Value Added Tax Act"),- ~~o~~
(1) after clause (15), the following clause shall be inserted and

shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 1st April
2005, namely :-

"(15A) "motor spirit" means,-

(a) High Speed Diesel Oil;'

(b) Aviation Turbine Fuel (Duty paid);

(c) Aviation Turbine Fuel (Bonded);

(d) Aviation Gasoline (Duty paid);

(I?),Aviat!on Gasoline (Bonded);

,.CfLPetrol, .'",,"""" '",' "

. .onmjrothetpmduct as th~Shtte Gpvernmentm;:ty, from time to,

." 'tillie, notify in the Official Gaze,tte;";. . ..'..' . . .
. '. . . (2) after clause (17), the following <;:lauseshall b~ inserted .and

shall be deemed to havebeel1 inserted with effect from the 1st April
2005, namely :- .



~ tmfit. ~- ~~I~j(lIr mtf 3fm'i. ~", ~O~~/~ ". m- ~,~~ ~

. "(IrA) f'petroleu1fiproducts" mean8,-
(a) Superior Ker(}se:neOil (BRO);

(b) Liquefied Petrohmm Gas (LPG);
(c) FurrtateOil (Fa);

(d) Light Diesel Oil (L1)O);
(e) Raw Naptha or Napthl1;

(fJ Low Sulpher Heavy Stock,
or any other product as-the Stnt@Government may,from time to
time, notify ih the Offil:!ialGazette t;
(3) in clause (29)j for the words "!Integtax leviable" the words

"sales tax or purchase taxlE!Viable"shall be aubstituted.

19. In section 3 of the Value Added TWtAct,-
(1) in sub-section (2),-

(a) for the words "turnover of'all sales" the words "turnover
either of all sales or, as the case tlUlYbe, purchases" shall be
substituted;

(b) . in the proviso,- .
(i) for the words" such sales" the wdrds " such sales and

purchases" shall be substituted;
(ii) for the words "turnover of sales" the worda "turnover of

sales or turnover of purchases!>shalt bt! Imb!ltituted;
(2) ih sub-section (3), for the words "tutMVer of liIales"the words

"turnover of sales or turnover of purchases" shull be substituted;
(3) in sub-section (4), for the words "tU1:'tiUverof sales", wherever

they occurs, the word "turnover" shall be substitut(\d;

(4) after sub-section (5),the followingsub-sectiOrtl'JhWlbe inserted,
namely:-

"(5A) For the purpose of calculating the limit of turnover of
purchases for liability to tax, the turnover of ptitchases ofthe goods
that are liable to purchase tax as specified in sections 6A and 6B
shall be considered. The provisions of sub-section (5) in respect of j

sales shall apply mutatis mutandis,",

20. After section 6 of the Value Added Tax Act,~

'. (1) the following section shall be inserted, :namely:-

Amendment
of section 3
of Mah. IX
of 2005.

.Insertion of
: sections 6A

and 6B in Mah.
IX of 2005.

"GA.(1) There shall be levied a purchase tax on the turnOV~t
of purchases of cotton purchased, directly or througb. a commission
agent, from a person who is not a dealer or a dealer who is not a
registered dealer, i~-

(a) the cotton so purchased are dispatched outside the State,
to any place within India, not by reason of sale, ta.his own place
of business or of his agent; or

'I1TTT 3110 - ~ I;,- ~

Purchase
tax payable
on
purchases
of cotton.



Zo

Purchase
tax payable

on
purchases

of oil
seeds.

Amendment
of section 8
of Mah. IX

of 2005.

-.J

~vm:r;f'~ mm:m-or'$1'~3ITO,'~ ~~; ~o~~/~ ~, m ~~~~

(b) the cotton so purchased are used in.themanufacture of-

(i) tax free goods; or

(ii) taxable goods, and the goods so manufactured are
dispatched outside the State, to any place:within India, not
by reason of sale, to his own place of business or; of his agent.

(2) The rate of purchase tax. shall be equ;).].to th~xate of sales
tax set out against the aforE1saicigoodsin S9H~DULE C.";

(2) after-sectioll)6A assoins~:rted, the following section shall be
inserted, namely :-

t'6B,'(1) There-shall be levied a purchase, tax on the turnover
of purchases. of oil seeds purchased;-directly or through a
commission agent, from.a person who is not a dealer or a dealer
who is not a registered dealer, if,- ','

, (a) the Oil seeds so purchased are dispatch~d o~tside the
State; to any place within Irl~ia,<not'byreasonof sale, to his
own place of business or of his agent; or

(b) the Oil seeds so purchased are used in the manufacture of -
(i) tax free goods; or

(ii) taxable goods, .and .tJ;1egoods so manufactured are
di!';patched outside th~ State, to any place within India, not
byreas().I). of sale, to his own place of business or of his agent.

(2) The ra.t~ of purchase tax shall be equal to the rate of sales
tax s~(out against the aforesaidgoo~s in SCHEDULE C,",

21. In section 8 of the Value Added Tax Act,-

(1) ip. sub-section (3),-
(£i)for th~ word "developer" the words "developer or

co-developer" shall be substituted;

"0 (b) in the Explanation, for clause (e);the followingclauses shall
be !,ubstituted, namely:-

"(e) a developer of the Special<Economic Zo:Q.emeans, a
person,-

(i) or a bod,}' of, p~~sons, company, firm or Government
undertaking: who develops, builds, designs, organizes,
promotes, finances, or transfers by way of sale or lease,
operates or maintains whole or a part of the infrastructure
in the Special Economic Zone, and

(ii)'who has been-certified by the Commissioner;
.,-. . , ,'.,v' ,

(e-a) a Co-developer means a person,- :
(i) who has. entered into an agreement with the Developer

" ", ", . "

to deve~op; b.p.,i1.d\,'c(e,sign,organi~e, prowotc:, finance, or
transfer by way of sale, or lease, op~r~teor' p1aipt~in whole



~ mW1 ~ "I'tiI~I(':'I.~ 3ffi), 1('IJr~L~Io..,~o~~/~ 10..,~ ~'r~'lf

or a parlof the infrastructure in the Special Economic Zone,
and

(ii) who has b~en certified by the Commissioner;";

(2) in sub-section (3C), after the figures "1957 " the words, figures
and letters "as it stood immediately before the 8th April 2011" shall
be added. .

~~

22. In section 10 ofthe Value Added Tax Act,- Amendment

(1) in sub-section (2), for the words "State 'Government may ~~:~ct~~h.
appoint" the words "State Government may appoint a Special IX of 2005.
Commissioner and" shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (4), for the words "and the Additional
Commissioner" the words "a Special Commissioner of Sales Tax and
the Additional Commissioner" shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (7), for the words "of Additional Commissioner"
the words "of a Special Commissioner or Additional Commissioner"
shall be substituted,

23. In section 20 of the Value Added Tax Act, after sub-section (5), Amendment
the following sub-section shall be added, namely :- of section. 20 of Mah.

"(6) Where a person or a dealer fails to file a return within the IX of 2005.
prescribed time, as provided under this section, then the said person
or dealer shall, before filing of the said return, pay, by way of late
fee, an amount of rupees five thousand. This amount shall be in
addition to any other amount payable, if any, as per return.".

24. In section 26 ofthe Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (6), the Amendment
following proviso shall be added, namely :- of section26 of Mah.

"Provided that, if at the request of the appellant, the appellate IX of 2005.
authority or the Tribunal has granted three adjournments or the
appellant fails to attend on the date fixed for hearing !:>ythe appellate
authority or the Tribunal. on three occasions,' whether consecutive
or not then,- .

(a) (i) the stay, if any, shall not be continued unless an amount
equal to fifteen per cent. of the amoUnt so disputed in appeal or
rupees fifteen crore, whichever is less is paid into the Government
Treasury within the time mentioned in the order by the appellate
authority or the Tribunal for this purpose.

Explanation.-The amount of fifteen per cent. or rupees fifteen
crore referred to above shall be inclusive of any part paYment
made earlier towards the disputed amount;

(ii) ifthe appellant fails to pay the amount so enhanced,;within
such time as mentioned in the order by the appellate authority
or Tribunal, the amount in dispute shall be recoverable and all
orders to the contrary shall stand vacated; .

(b) the appellate authority or the Tribunal shall accordingly
modify the order of stay, if any, pending the disposal of the said
appeal ;

'11fT! 3TIO-~<..-~31



r~ ~ ~ 'fI'iifIB dI~tI€ll(ul '1T'Tamr;~~,"" ~.~'t/~ ,",,'~ ~'~'If

(c) notwithstanding anything contained in clAuSe(i) of sub-section
(2) of section 85, no appeal shall lie against the order passed under
clause (a) above.",

Insertionof 25. After section 26 ofthe Value Added Tax Act, the followingsection
s~ction26A shall be inserted, namely :-In Mah. IX

of 2005.

Regulating
. f1ling'of

appeal by
Commisssio.

ner'.

Amendment
of section

29 of Mah.
IX of 2005.

~A.. (l}TheCommissioner may,.from time tt>time. issue orders,
instructions or directions for fIXingsuch monetary limits as he may
deem fit, for the purpose of regulating filing of appeal as per the
provisions of section 27.

(2) Where, in pursuance of the orders, instructions or directions
issue~ under sub-section (1), the Commissioner has not filed any
appeal on any issue in the case of any appellant for any assessment
period, it shall not preclude the Commissioner from filing an appeal
on the same issue in the case of-

(a) the same appellant for any other assessment period; or

(b) any other appellant for the same or any other assessment
period.

(3) Notwithstanding that no appeal has been filed pursuant to the
orders or instructions or directions issued under sub-section (1), it
shall not be lawful for any appellant, being a party in any appeal, to
contend that the Commissioner has acquiesced in the decision on
the disputed issue by not filing an appeal in any case.

(4) The Court-,>r, as the case may be, Tribunal hearing such
appeal shall have regard to the orders, instructions or directions
issued under sub-section (1) and the circumstances under which such
appeal was filed or not filed in respect of any case.

(5) Every order, instructions or direction which has been issued
by the Commissioner fixing monetary limits for filing an appeal shall
be deemed to have been issued under sub-section (1) and the
provisions of sub-sections (2), (3) and (4) shall apply accordingly.

(6) The provisions of sub-section (7) of section 23, so far as it
relates to the giving effect to the Court order, shall also apply to
the cases where the Commissioner has not filed the appeal as
provided under sub-section (2) of this section.".

26. In section 29 ofthe Value Added Tax Act,-

(1) before sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be
inserted, .namely :-

"(2A) While or after passing any order in respect of any dealer
under any provisions of this Act, it appears to the Commissioner
that, the dealer has failed to apply for registration as required



~ VImif ~4ttUql(UI-~~, .~~, ~O~~~ to.,W-~'t1~. n
.~.

under this Act or has carded on ;business as a dealer without being
registered in contravention of the provisions of this Act, then the

ComlJ;1is,sioJl~rJP.aYJafter giving the dealer a reasonable
opportunityqfbeingheard, impose upon him, by.way of penalty,

a sum equal t~ the amount of tax pa,yable by the dealer for the
period during which he has carried on b~sin~s.s as a dealer without
being registered inc~mtravention of the provi.sions of this Act.";

(2) sub-section (8) shall be deleted. .
27. After section 31 of the Value Added Tax Act, the following section Insertion of

shall be inserted, namely:- ~ection31AIn Mah. IX
of 2005.

"3IA. (1) The State Government may, by notification in Official
Gazette,"and subject to such conditions and restrictions as may be
specified in the notification, require any person, local bodies or
authorities or agencies under the Central Government or, as the case
may be, the State Government,~

(a) who auction the rights for excavation of sand within their
jurisdiction, to collect an amount at such rate as provided in sub-
section (2), towards the liability of sales tax to be incurred on sale
of sand by the auction purchaser, on auction of sand;

(b) who has temporary possession./or"control over the goods as
may be notified, pending clearance of the said goods by the
purchaser, to collect an amount at such rate as provided in
sub-section (2), towards the liability of sales tax to be incurred by
the purchasing dealer on sale of such goods.

(2) The State Government may, by the like notification in the
Official Gazette, specify such rate from time to time, at which such
amount shall be collected by any person, local bodies or authorities
under the Central Government or, as the case may, be, the State
Government, under clauses (a) and (b) of sub-section (1).

(3) The amount so collected shall be paid into the Government
Treasury by the authorities referred to in clauses (a) and (b) of
sub-section (1) in the manner prescribed. The amount so paid under

I

tlris section shall be deemed to have been paid on behalf of the auction
purchaser, dealer or person and it shall be adjusted towards their
tax liability, if any.".

Collection
and
payment
towards tax.

28. In section 41 ofthe Value Added Tax Act, insub-section (4),after Amendment

clause (b), the following clause shall be added, namely:- ' of sef
ct
M
ion

h. . 41 0 . a .
"(c) on the sales of the furnishing cloth as specified !in the IX of 2005.

notification issued under entry 101 of SCHEDULE C, at a point other
than the last point of sales in the State.".



-
~'t ~ mwr ~ ~~I~I«UI 'fPT 3TIO..~lo..~o~~/~ lo..~ ~~~'II'

29. In section 45 of the Value Added Tax Act.-

(1) in sub-section (1),-

(a) for the words"sells any taxable goods" the words "sells or
purchases any taxable goods" shall be substituted; -

(b) for the words "turnover of such sales" the words "turnover
of such sales or purchases" shall be substituted;

. (2) in sub-section (2). for the words "sold any" the words "sold or
purchased any" shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (3).-

. (a) for the word "sells" the words "sells or-purchases" shall be
substituted;

(b) for the words "turnover of such sales" the words "turnover
of such sales or purchases" shall be substituted;

(c) in the proviso. for the words "such sale" the words "such
sale or purchase" shall be substituted,

Amendment 30. In section 59 ofthe Value Added Tax Act. in sub-section (1). in
-of section the proviso, for the words "Thane District" the words "Thane and Raigad
09 of Mah. D

"
t

'
t" hall b . b t '

t t dIX of 2005. IS nc s e su s I u e ,

Amendment
of section

45 of .Mah.
IX of 2005.

Amendment
of section

86 of Mah.
IX of 2005.

Amendment
of section

94 of Mah.
IX of 2005.

Validation
and savings.

31. In section 86 of the Value Added Tax Act,-

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words "three years" the words "eight
years" shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituteo with effect from the-1st April 2005 ;

(2) in sub-section (3), for the words "three years" the words "eight
years" shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effectfrom the 1st April 2005,

32. In section 94 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (1), for
the words "sales tax liability" the -words "sales tax or purchase tax
liability" shall be substituted.

CHAPTER X

VALIDATION AND SAVINGS,

33. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree
or order of any Court or Tribunal to the contrary, any assessment,
review, levy or-collectionof tax in respect of sales or purchases effected
by any dealer or person , or any action taken or thing done in relation
to such assessment, review, levy or collection of tax by any dealer or
person under the provisions of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, Mah.

2002 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as "the Value Added Tax IX of
Act"), during the period commencingconthe 1st April 2005 and ending, 2005.
on and including the date immediately preceding the date of the
commencement of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment and Mah.

Validation), ,Act,2012 (hereinaft~r, in t~is C~apter, refen:ed to ~s "the ~n
Amendment Act"), shall be deemed to be valId and effectIve as If such 2012.
assessment, review, levy or collection or'action or thing had been duly



~ 'iffiA' ~ <It<HI~I<UI 'iWT 3110, ~ ~~, ~o~~/cbmsr~, $ ~'f~~ ~lo,

made, taken or done under the Value Added Tax Act, as amended by
the Amendment Act, and accordingly,-

(a) all acts, proceedings or things done or taken by the State
Government or by any officer of the State Government or by any
other authority in connection with the assessment, review, levy or
collection of any such tax, shall, for all purposes, be deemed to be,
and to have always been done or taken in accordance with the law;

(b) no suit, appeal, application or other proceedings shall lie or
be maintained or continued in any Court or before any Tribunal,
officer or other authority, for the refund of any taX so paid; and

(c) no Court, Tribunal, officer or other authority shall enforce any
decree or order directing the refund of any such tax.

(2) For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that nothing in
sub-section (1) shall be construed as preventing a person,-

(a) from questioning in accordance with the provisions of the
Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the Amendment Act, any
assessment, review, levy or collection of tax referred to in sub-section
(1), or

(b) from claiming refund of any tax paid by him in excess of the
amount due from him by way of tax under the Value Added Tax Act,
as amended by the Amendment Act.

(3) Nothing in the Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the
Amendment Act, shall, render any person liable to be convicted of any
offence in respect of anything done or omitted to be done by him, before
the commencement of the Amendment Act, if such act or omission was
not an offence under the Value Added Tax Act, but for the amendments
made by the Amendment Act; nor shall any person in respect of such
Act or omission be subject to a penalty have greater than that which
could have been imposed on him under the law in force immediately
before the commencement of the Amendment Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVER1\'MENT PRIJI,"IDIG, STATIOI\'ERY AI"II) PUBUCATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURA1\{ JAGAI\'NATH

GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERI\'ME!'.'T CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SL'BHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 A.."'D PUBUSHED AT

DlRECI'ORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIO:o.'ERY M'D PL'BUCATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARN! ROAD, MUMBA14OO 004,
EDITOR: SHRIPARSHlJRAMJAGANNATHGOSAVI.


