
RNI No. MAHENG12OO9135528

Reg. No. MHlMRJSouth-34412011-13'

I
~~

~~~
~~3{TO

~ ~, R ,",o(~)] ~. mfn qo,~o~~~,. - ~'qq (~~, ~: m ~~.oo

3t't'lI~Uo(QI~..ic:e. ~~o

~ ~~':f""

+1t;I'tI"X~ql"";6GDI..a ~R.P'q... q 't1'"C4"I('1i~1HQC4.fQ~~ ~~I~:tl q ~ f4P'q+1

snfUT ~ (f ~ ~I.tlq,~... ~ Rt~q~ (~ ~).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Bombay Civil Courts (Amendment) Act, 2011 (Mah. Act
No. XLIV of 2011), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

H. B. PATEL,
Secretary to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

MABARASHTRA ACT No. XLIV OF 2011.

(First published, after having received the assent of the President
in the" Maharashtra Government Gazette ", on the 30th December
2011.)

An Act further to amend the Bombay Civil Courts Act, 1869.

~N~f WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Bombay Civil Courts
1869.Act, 1869, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted

in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

I. (1) This Act may be called the Bombay Civil Courts (Amendment) Short title
Act, 2011. ~:~mence-

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government ment.
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

(~)
'WT :mo-~~o-~



':( ~ ~ TfiI'q"Sf ""tiI~'~U' 1WT 3(10, ~ ~o,~o~~/~ 't. m ~'t~~

Amendm~nt 2. In section 16 of the Bombay Civil Courts Act, 1869 (hereinafter
of sectIOn

re .L'", ",rt t o as "th", ",-..in";",,,l A"t"\ rn r the """, 1" """"0 l akh ~'H..aa"" t he16 of Act 1'-.. ~- . ...~ .,.-"'--1"'-- . ~_. " ~~ .. ~~--- "h. ""'I"~vu u.
XN of words "ten lakh rupees" shall be substituted.

1869.
Amendment

of section
24 of Act

XIV of
1869.

Act No.
XIV of
U:lti9.

3. In section 24 of the principal Act,-

(a) for the words "one lakh rupees" the words "five lakh rupees"
shall be substituted ;

(b) in the proviso, for the words "one lill rupees to one lakh'
fifty thousand rupees" the words "five lakh rupees to seven lakh
fifty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

4. In section 26 of the principal Act, for the words "two lakh
rupees" the words "ten lakh rupees" shall be substituted.

Amendment
of section
26 of Act

XIV of
1869.

Amendm~nt 5. In section 28A of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), forof sectlOn lakh akh b28A of Act the words "two rupees" the words "ten 1 rupees" shall e
XIV of substituted.

1869.

Insertion of 6. After section 28A ofthe principal Act, the following section shallsection 28B
b

.
rted I

'

in Act XIV e mse , name y :-
of 1869.

Transfer of
pending

suits and
appeals.

"28B. On the commencement of the Bombay Civil Courts ~'tv
(Amendment)Act, 2011,- of

(1) all suits in which the amount or value of the subject matter 2011.
does not exceed rupees five lakhs and which are pending before
the Court of Civil Judge (Senior Division), immediately, before
such commencement, shall stand transferred. to the concerned
Court of Civil Judge (Junior Division) and such court may deal
with such suit from the stage which was reached before such
transfer or from any earlier stage or de-novo as such court may'
deem fit ;

(2) all appeals in which the amount or value of the subject
matter does not exceed rupees ten lakhs and pending before the
High Court immediately before such commencement, shall stand
transferred to the concerned District Court and such District
Court may deal with such appeal from the stage which was
reached before such transfer or from any earlier stage or de-novo
as such court may deem fit :

Provided that, this section shall not apply to any suits and
appeals which are pending before the Court of Civil Judge (Senior
Division) or, as the case may be, before the High Court, which
are statutorily provided under the relevant enactment before
such Court.",

ONBEHA.L/;<' Ol" GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBliSHED BY SHRl PARSHURAM

JAGANNATH G<&. VI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT(,'EN'rnAL~, 21-A,NEl' AJ1 SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004
AND PUBlJSHED ATDIRECl'ORATE OF GOVERNMENI' PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBlJCATlON, 21-A, NE:I'A.JI SUBHASH ROAD,
CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400004, EDITOR : SHPJPARSHURAMJAGAI~NATH (',(SA VI.


