RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

L
ATt

He & IMMHA IS99
AHEINUT HUT AS

a¥ 3, @+ ()] TTEAR, i R, evg/dwmE g, W %33 [ gL e, FEww o v ty.oo

FHARUT HHEH wo
BUDET R CANC
mny faummewe sfuftaw @ vwwei gemfee Fee sty @ Feet fafmEm
arfr fafer & = fommega aeen fadas (@t aea).

In pursuance of ¢lause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment and Validation)
Act, 2011 (Mah. Act. No. XV of 2011), is hereby published under the authority of the
Governor. ' ' )

By order and in the nanie of the Governor of Maharashtira,

I, B. PATEL,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.
MAIARASHTRA ACT No. XV OF 2011.
{ First published, after having received the assent of the Governor
in the “ Maharashira Government Gazette ”, on the 215t April 2011.)
An Act further to amend certain tax laws in operation in the
State of Maharashira.

WIHEREAS it is expedient further to amend ceriain tax laws in
operatien in the State of Maharashtra, for the purposes hereinafier
appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-second Year of the
Republic of India as follows -

CHAPTER

_ “PrELATINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Tax Laws {Levy, Shor title
Amendment and Validation) Aet, 2011. ?:imcnw_

(2) (a) Section 1 shall come into foree on the date of the publication meat.
of this Act in the Official Gazetle.

{6) Section 19 (1) shall come into force with effect from the date on
which the Finance Act, 2011 comes into force.

(¢} Save as otherwise provided in this Act, the remaining sections
shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint and different dates may be
appointed for different provisions.

()

HT HIZ ~o—-f,



Amendmenti

o
SCHEDULE
I of Bom.
L.X of 1958.

HERIE JMEH {AUF AR I &3, THE 2R, 0W/EAE R, T& 133

CHAPTERII .

AvENDMENTS TO THE BoMBAY STAMp AcT, 1958

2. In SCHEDULE 1 ap‘pcnded t0 the Bombay Stamp Act, 1958,—

(¢)-in article 5,—

(f) in clause (&), in column 2, for the words and figures "One .

rupece for every rupces 10,000 or part thereof.” the figures and
words “0.005 per cent. of the amount of a bill of exchange." shall
be substituted;

(tij in clause (b), in column 2, for the words and figures “Fifty
puise for every rupees 1,00,000 or part thereof ” the figures and
words “ 0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

(iti) in clause (¢),-- .

{A) in sub-clause (i), in column 2, for the words and figures

“One rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof ™ the figures

and words “ 0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

(B) in sub-¢lause (iz), in column 2, for the words and figures

“ One rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part therecof ” the figures

and words “ 0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

(iv) in elause fd), in column 2, for the words and f'igur%@
“ One rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thercof ™ the figures
and words “ 0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted,

(¢} in clause (e}, in column 2, for the words and figures “One
rupee for every rupces 10,000 or part thereof 7 the figures and
words “0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

(vi) in clause (), in column 2, for the words and figures
“One rupce for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof ” the figurcs
and words “ 0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

(vit) in clause (g), in column 2, for the words and figures “One
rupee for cvery rupeces 10,000 or part thercof ” the figures and
words “ 0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

(vity) in clause (g-d),—

(A} in sub-clause (1),—

(1 in entry (A), in column 2, for the words “ T'wo thousand
rupces.” the words and figures “The same duty as is payable
under Article 60.” shall be substituted;

(2j for entry (1), the [bllowing cntry shall be substituted,
namely ;- .

“{B) for the purposc of residential
use,-- '
(I3 having area upto
27.88 square metres
(300 square feet);
{2) having area more The same duty as is
than 27.88 square metres  payable under Article
(300 square feet). 60.”;

Two hundred rupeces.

Bom.
ILX of
1958.




WERTE WIRT US NEERU WOT S, UHE IR, 0t/ R, TH 2833

(B) in sub-clause ({1),—

{7} in entry (A}, in column 2, for the words “One thousand
rupees.” the words and figures “The same duty as is payable under

" Article 60.” shall be substituted ;

(2) for eatry (B), the following eniry shall be substituted,
ramely :— _
“(B) for the purposc of residential
use,-—
{I) having area upto 27.88 One hundred rupees,
squarc meires (300 square

feet);

(2) having arca more than The same duty as is
27.88 squarc metres (300 payable under Article
square feet). : 60.7; .

(C) 1n sub-clause (#iz),—

(I} in entry (A}, in column 2, for the words “Four hundred
rupees.” the words and figures “The same duty as is payabic under
Article 60.” shail be substituted;

(2) for entry (13), the following entry shall be substituted,
namely -

“B) for the purpose of residential
use,

{1) having arca upto 27.88 IFifty rupees.
squarc metres (300 square

fect);

{2} having arca more than The same duly as is
27.88 squarc metres (300 payable under Article
square feet). 60.7;

(b) in article 43,—

(i) in clause (@), in column 2, for the words and figures "One
rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof," the figures and
words "0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted; '

{ii) in clause (b), in column 2, for the words and figures "One
rupee for every rupees 10,000 or pari thercof,” the figures and
words “0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted; ’

(iii} in clause (¢), in column 2, for the words and figures "One
rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof)” the figures and
words "0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

{iv) in clause fd), in column 2, for the words and figures "One
rupee for every rupces 10,000 or part thercof * the figures and
words "0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted; ,

(v) in clause (e), in column 2, for the words and figures "One
rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof " the figures and -
words "0.005 per cent." shall be substituted;



% TERTE TIEA 0T FEERTT W07 #6, e ], 0tR/AwwE ¢, TR RR3R

{vi) in clause {f}, in column 2, for the words and figures “One rupee
for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof " the figures and words "0.005
per cent.” shall be substituted ;

fvii) in clause {g), in column 2, for the words and figures “Fifty
paise for every rupees 1,00,000 or part thereof ” the figures and words
“0.005 per cent.” shall be substituted;

(c) in article 51A,—

(1) in ciause (), in column 2, for the words “Fifty rupees for every
rupecs one crore or part thereof” the figures and words “0.005 per
cent.” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (b},—

(A) in sub-clause (i}, in column 2, for the words and figures “Once
rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof.” the figures and
words “0.005 per cent. of the value of the security.” shall be
substituted; °

(B} in sub-clause (i), in column 2, for the words and figurcs
“T'wenty paise for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof.” the figures
and words "0.005 per cent. of the value of the security.” shall be
substituted;

{iif) in clause fe), in column 2, for the words and figures “Twentig
puise for every rupees 10,000 or part thercof.” the figures and words
“0.005 per cent. of the value of the futures and options trading.”
shall be substituted;

“rl'\

(tv) in clausce (d), in column 2, for the words and {igures “One
rupee for every rupees 1,00,000 or pari thereof.” the figures and
words “0.005 per cent. of the value of the forward coniract.” shatl _
be substituted.

CHAPTERIH

AMENDMENTS TC THE MAHARASHTRA PURCHASE TAX ON
Stearcaxe Acr, 1962

Amendment 3. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Mah,
offeition 2 Act, 1962 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Purchase [Xof
of 1962. Tax on Sugarcane Act™), after clause (), the following clause shall be '
added, namely:— ‘
“(I) "yoar" means the year starting from the 1% day of October and
ending on the 30% day of September next following 7.

Inseriion of 4. After section 3 of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcanc Act, the
section 3A g : cnpd y 1nSerte : —
in a, X following sceclion shall be inserted, namely:

of 1962,

Application “3A. Subject to the provisions of this Act and the rules made Mah.
prog}sfg:;tsal)r} thercunder, the provisions of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, é}éo%f
Mabarashira 2002 and the rules made thercunder, so far as they relate io the '
Val“%a[}\(digs electronic filing of returns and eclectronic payment of tax, or any

2002 and amount payable under this Act, shall mutatis mutandis apply for the

u’;‘éﬁiﬁﬁ?ﬁf purposes of this Act.”.




TR IEA UWOR FEUROT UTT 37E, T R, R0%R/dvRE g, e R]3d W !

5. In section 5 of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, in sub-
section (4), for the word "June" the word “September" shall be
substituted. _ :

6. In section 6 of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act,—

{1) in sub-section (2), for the words “full amount of tax leviable”
the words "the amount payable as prescribed” shall be substituted;

{2) for sub-secction (4), the following sub-scction shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(4) Where a return is submitted to the Commissioner without
making the payment of the amount of tax as preseribed under section 3,
the amount or the remaining unpaid amount, shall be paid by the

" Amendment

of section 5
of Mah. IX
of 1962.

Amendment
of section 6
of Mah. IX
of 1962.

occupier into a Government Treasury or the Reserve Bank of India -

on or before the date specificd in the notice served by ihe

Commissioner for this purpose, being a date not later than tén days

from the date of semvice of the notice.”.

7. After section- 6 of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcanc Act, the
following section shall be inserted, namely -—

“GA. (I} Notwithstanding anything contained in this Aet or the
rules made and notifications issued thercunder, the assessment of
tax and payment of tax in respect of the transitional accounting
year shall be made in such manncr as may be prescribed.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this sub-scction, the period
beginning on the 1st day of April 2010 and ending on the 30th day
of September 2011 shail be decemed to be the "transitional accounting
year” for levy and colleetion of tax. . .

(2) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of this
section, during the period of three years from the. date of

* Mah, commencement of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment
}égl?f and Validation) Act, 2011, the State Government may, as occasion

arises, by an order published in the Official Gazelte, do anything not
inconsistent with the provisions of this Act, which appears to it to
be necessary or expedient for the purpose of removing the difficulty.

{3) Every order made under this section shall be'laid, as soon as
may be, after it is made, before cach House of the State Legislature.”.

8. TIn seclion 7 of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcanc Act, in sub-
section (1), the Explanation shall be deleted.

9. In scction 7B of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(1) If an occupicr fails to submit the return as reqﬁired by sub-
section (1) of section 6 or to pay the amount payable as prescribed
as required by sub-section {2} of that section, he shall, in addition to

HET AE ~L4o0—R

.

Insertion af
scction BA In
Mah.IX of
1962, -

Special
provisions
{or
transitiona]
accounting

“year.

Amendment
of section 7
of Mah. 1X
of 1962.

Amendment
of section
7B of Mah.
1X of 1962.



g HERY YIGH TAYS FETERU 9 and, uider v, voRe/dumE v, w9133

_ the tax and the penalty, if any, pay simple interest on the amount
‘due at the rate of one and a guarter per cent. for each month
from the date immediately following the last day as prescribed till
the date the occupier continues to make default in the payment
of the amount duc.

Kxplanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, where an
occupier fails to submit the return in due time, the amount of
tax assessed under section 7 shall be deemed to be the amount of
tax due from the occupier under sub-section (2) of scction 6.7

(2) in sub-section {£), the words, brackets and figure “sub-scetion
(1) of "-shal} be deleted.

~

Insertion’ef 10, Alter section 7D of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcane ‘Act, the

section 7 N shall be N .
o X following secction inserted, namely :

of 1862.

Refund of “7E. If any amount of tax becomes refundable to an occupier of
pa}_n:’e’;‘f?{. the factory or the uni.t as per the return .for the month of
tax.  Jeptember then, ithe said amount shall be refunded 1o the said
occupier within: six months, from the due date prescribed for filing ]
the return forthe m(mth of Sepiember or, as the case may be, the
date on which the réturn for the montl of September is filed,

whichever is later.” : -

.

CHAPTERIV
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRRA VALUE ADDED Tax AcT, 2002

Amendment 11, In section” 16 of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002 ]\;{(ahf
o}

°f;,°‘{;”[$ﬁ‘ %g {hereinafter, in this' Chapter, referred to as “the Value Added Tax g 4
of 2005. Act”)— '
{e) in sub-section (2}, for the provisoe, the following proviso shall _
be substituted, namely — . - {
“Provided that, if the applicalion is made on or after the
commencement of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment Mah.
and Validation) Act, 2011, by a person who voluntarily desires to gi) IXIV
got registered, the application shall not be entertained, unless
the applicant has deposited an amount of rupees 25,000 in the
Government Treasury by way of security deposit and the amount
so deposited shall not be adjusted against the tax payable as per .
any return or towards any other liability under this Act.”;

(b} after sub-scction (2), the fol]owmg sub-section shall be inserted,
namely » — -

“(2A) The sceurity deposit deposited under the proviso to
sub-section (2) shall be refundable on such conditions, restrictions
. and within such time as.may be prescribed. The scecurity deposit
shall be forfeited, if there is no compliance of such conditions,
restrictions and time limit.”.

.



WERTE JTEA {TAUN FATHET W &7, UHer R2, RoRy/AWIA g, Wi gR33 9

12, In section 20 of Vdlue Added Tax Act, in sub-section (4),—
(1) the words “or, as the case may be, a revised return” shall be
- deleted;
(2) in clause (¢}, 7
{a) for the word “nince” the word “ten” shall be substituted;
() the words "or, as the case may k‘m,‘ the revised return ” shall
be deleted ; : ‘ '
{(3) afler clausc (¢), the following proviso shall be added, namely 1 —
“Provided that, any such person or dealer may furnish not
more than one revised return under cach of the aforesaid clauses
and such revised return may include revision of return or revised
return filea earlior.”.
13. 1In sccuion 26 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section &),
clause {¢i shall he deleted.

14. In scetion 47 of the Value Added Tax Act, after sub-section {4},

the following sub-seeiion shall be added, namely -~
“(5) Subject o such conditions and rqstz-igti()r{s as it may imposc,
the State Government may, by notification in the Official Gazetle,
provide for exemption from the payment of full or part of the taxes
payable on any class or classes of sales of liquor by any class or
classes of dealers.”™
15. In section 50 of the Value Added 'l‘ax'AcL, in sub-scetion (1), for
the words “tax, penalty, interest” the words and figures “tax, penalty,
interest, seccurity deposit deposited under section 18”7 shall be
substituted. '

16. In section 51 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
(1) in sub-section (2),—

(e)-in clause (&), for the words “within onc monih of the
receipt of the application” the words “on receipt of the application”
shall be substituted ; '

{6) ciause (b) shall be deleted;

{2} in sub-seciion (3),-—
{e) in clause (u), -~
(i) sub-clausc fiv) shall be deloted; . .
(ii) after sub-clause (v), a{'t.cr the words "fresh return or
revised return.” the following Explenciion shall be added,
namely -

“Baplunation.—For the purpeses of sub-clause-(r), the
expression "exporter” shall mean a registered dealer whose
turnover of exports during such period as may be prescribed,
is not less than such percentage of the total turnover of his
sales as may be prescribed in this behalfl”,

W 1S Aaon 29 '

Amendment
of scclion 20
of Mah. IX
of 2005.

Amendment
of scetion 26
of Mah. IX
of 2005.

Amendment
of section 41
of, Mah. 1X
of 2005.

Amendment
of scction 50
of Mah. iX
of 2005,

Amendment
of section 51
of Mah. X of
2006.



¢ TERTE WA 0 STHTERUL W oS, UMW R, Roqy/ANNE ¢, ¥ R3F

(b) for clause (4), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely \—

" “p) The Commissioner, on receipt of the said application,

may require the dealer to furnish such bank guarantee for

such amounts from such banks, for such periods and to such

authorities as may be prescribed.”;

(:3) for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the
1st April 2011, namely:— ' ‘

“(1) Save as otherwise provided in this section, the

Commissioner shall grant the refund under this section within

eighteen months from the end of the month containing the date

of the receipt of the application for refund : '
Provided that, where a dealer has filed an application for
refund under this section on or before the 31st March 2011, then,

nolwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (4) as it existed -

~prior to the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Tax

Laws (l.evy, Amendment and Validation) Act, 2011, the

Commissioner shall,— X

: #A

{a) in respect of the periods ending on or before the 31st

March 2010, grant the refund to such dealer on or before the
30th September 2011, and '

(&) in respect of the periods beginning with the st April 2010

and ending on the 31st March 2011, grant the refund to such
dealer on or before the 30th June 2012.7;

{4) in sub-scction {7), for the words “threc yecars” the words
“pighteen months” shall be substituted.
Amendment  17. In section 61 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
of section 617 . .
of Mah. IX (1) in sub-section (1},— ‘

of 2000.
’ (a) for the words "report of such audit” the words "complete

report of such audit” shall be substituted ;

(b) ihe existing Fxplunation shall be re-numbered as Explanation-]
thercof'; and after the Explanation-I as so re-numbered, the
following Kxplanation shall be added, namely -—

“Hxplunation-f{--For the purposes of this section, an audit
report shali be deemed to be the "complete audit report™ only if
all the items, certifieations, tables, schedules and annexures are
filled appropriately and are arithmetically self-consistent.”™
(2) after sub-section (2), the f'oHowing sub-section shall be inserted,

namely:-—

“(2A) Where a dealer liable to file audit report under this section
has knowingly furnishedl the audit report which is not complete,
then the Commissioner may, after giving a reasonable opportunity

Mah,
of XV
2011.




HERTE, WA {199 FEMWU IFT 316, UM IR, 0%3/d9mE R, W {33 ¢ ]

of being heard, impose on him, in addition to any tax payable or
any other penalty leviable under this section or any other section,
a sum by way of penalty equal to one tenih per cent., of the tofal .

sales.”. ,
18. In scetion 74 of the Value Added Tax Act, after sub-section (1), Amendment
‘the following sub-scction shall be inserted, namely :— §§ ﬁ;ﬂ_"%{”
’ of 2003,

“C1A)T) Whoever knowingly with the intention te defraud revenie,
issues or produces a falsc tax invoice and thereby makes a false claim
. in respect of the set-off or the refund, or claims any other deduction
that results into reduced tax Hability or enhances the amount of
refund, or
(i) abets any of the aforesaid-offences, ‘
shall, on conviction, be punished with rigorous imprisonment for a term
which shall not be less than one year but which may extend to two
vears and with fine.”. ‘

19. In SCHEDRULE A appended to the Value Added Tax Act,—
(1} in entry 45, in column (2), for the words, brackets and figures
“the Additional Duties of Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act,
' 1957” the words, brackets and figures “ the Additional Dutics of Excise
{Goods of Speeial Importance) Act, 1957 as it stood prior to the date

Amendment

of SCHEDULK - -

A appended
to Mah, 1X
of 2005.

on which the Finance Act, 2011 comes into force” shall be substituted; |

(2) in entry 55, in column {2)_, in ciausc‘,{c‘}, for the words “Dhoop
including Loban” the words “Dhoop including lLoban and Ral”
shall be substituted ; _

(8} after eniry 56, the following entry shall be inserted, namely -—

- “56A. Pre-fabricated domestic
bi.ogas units Nil.

20. In SCHEDULE C appended to the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) -in entry 4, in sub-entry (a), in column {3), for the figure and

‘sign’_“/i-%” the figure and sign “5%” shall be substituted;

(2) in entry 8, in cofumn (3), for the figure and sign-“A%" the
figure and sign “5%" shall be substituted; '

{3) in entry 22, in column (3), for the figure and sign “14%” the
figure and sign “5%” shall be substituted;

{4) in entry 25, in column (3), for the figure and sign “4%” the
figure and sign “5%” shall be substituted;

(5} in entry 27, in column (3), for the figure and sign “4%” the
figure and sign “5%” shall be substituted;

‘Amendment

of SCHEDUTE
C appended 1o
Mah. IX
of 2005.



%0 - WEHTY WG TSOA SEIMTWE W H6, THE W, R0RW/IVE R, W £33

(6) in entry 43, in column (3), for the figure and sign “4%” the

figure and sign “5%” shall be substituted;

{(7) in entry 55, in column (3), for the figure and sign “4%” the
figure and sign “5%” shall be substituted;

{8} in entry 57, in column (3), for the figurc and sign “4%” the

figure and sign “6%” shall be substituted;

(9) in entry 68, in column {3), {'or thc-ﬁgure and sign “4%” the
hgure and sign “D%” shall be substituted;

(10) in entry 94, in column (2), after sub- enLry (b}, the Iollowmg
sub-entry shall be added, namcly:ﬁ—-
“(e) Vada Pav - 5%

(17) in entry 101, in sub-entry {a), in column (3), for the figurc -

and sign “4%” the figure and sign "5%" shall be substituted;

J:A,
(12) after cntry 108, the [ollowing entry shall be inserted, .
aanielyi- -
“LO8A. Dry fruits excluding cashew -~ §%.7

kernels and cashew nuis and those

10 which entry 59 of SCHEDULE A applies.

Amc“dmcf;*t;' . 21. In SCHEDULE D appended to the Value Added Tax Act,—

SCHEDULE
[ appended (1} in entry 1, in column (3), for the f'gur(,s and sign “20%” the
to Mah. IX
of 2005.  figures and sign “50%” shall be substituted;

(2) in entry 2, in column (3), for the figurcs and sign “25%” the
figures and sign “50%” shall be sub'-;titut‘(‘d-

3

{3) In vn‘uy 3, in eolumn (3), for the figures and sign “2 a%” the

figures d:‘id slgn “50%” shall be substituted;

(1) after entry 12, the following entry shall be added, namely: -

“13. Acrated and Carbonated non- 20%.".
aleoholic beverage whether or not

containing sugar or other sweetening

matter or flavour or any other additives.




AT WA TOwE SEIOR W N6, THE R, 20%y/ETE 8, wH 9933

CHAPTERYV

~ VALIDATION AND SAVING

34

22. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree Validation

or order of any Court or Tribunal to the contrary, any assessment,

- review, levy, collection, refund or interest on reftnd of tax in respect

Mah.
X of
2005.

Mah.
KV of
2011

of sales or purchascs effected by any dealer or person, or any action
taken or thing donc in relation,to such assessment, review, levy,
collection, refund or interest on refund under the provisions of the
Maharashtra V atue Added Tax Act, 2002 (hereinafter, in ‘ths Chapter,
referred 10 as “the Value Added Tax Act 9, during the period (,omm{.nung
on the Ist April 2005 and ending on the date immediately preceding
the date of the commencement of the Maharashira Tax Laws (Levy,
Amendment and Validation) Act, 2011 thereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as "the Amendment Act™), shall be deemed to be valid and
cifective as if such assessment, review, levy, collection, refund or
interest on refund, or action or.thing had been duly made, taken or
done under the Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the Amendment
Act, and accordingly, —

(@) all acts, proceedings or things done or taken by the State
Government or by any officer of the State Government or by any
other auth.ority in connection with the asscssment, review, levy,
collection or refund ol any such tax, shall, for all purposes, be deemed
to be, and to have always been done or taken in accordance with
the law; '

(b} no suit, appeal, application or other proceedings shall lie or
be maintained or continued in any Court or before any Tribunal,
officer or other authority, for the refund of any tax so paid; and

(¢) no Court, 'I‘mbuna.l officer or other authority shall enforce any
decree or order dwcctmg the refund of any such tax.

(2 For the removal of doubts, it is hcr(_:by declared that nothing in

 sub-section () shall be construed as preventing a person,--

{a) from questioning in accordance with the provisions of the Value
Added Tax Act as amended by the Amendnmient Aet, any assessment,
review, levy, collection or refund of tax referred to in sub-section (1),

or ‘

{b) from claiming refund of any tax paid by him in excess of the
amount due from him by way of tax under the Value Added Tax Act,
as amended by the Amendment Act,

and

saving.

-



237 . HENTY IR TAAT FEGRT W HG, T W, R/ R, TH R

(3) Nothing in the Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the
Amendment Act, shall, render any person liable 10 be convicted of any
offence in respect of anything done or omitted 1o be done by him,
beforc the commencement of the Améndment Act; if such aci or
orhission was not an offence under the Value Added Tax Act but for
the amendments made by the Amendment Aet; nor shall any person
in respect of such act or omission be subject to a pcnalty greater than
that which could have been imposged on him under the law in force
immediately before the commencement of the Amendment Act.

B /!
_ON BEHALF QF GOVERNMENT PRINT,NG, STATIONERY AND FUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHR! PARSHURAM JAGANNATH
" GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRA! LA, NETAJD SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNT R0AD, MUMBAT 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT
DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING. S'I‘z\'I'IO\'L RY AND PUBLICATION, 21 A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNIROAD, \tIL"\ﬂ}AI 500004,
EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVL




