w7, W B4 qm A Ty, Rov/ohy 7y, WA ERaz | U R, T . wud 3g.e0

WA B *
WIFaeRer TRTHr
werTe. Pz afufren 7 Teeqwit e dets s e fafon

AR OTERT

T w0 w1 WEmTE sfufw wERE o ENY TRONES, TREEARE 8 79
aerfrE T sfefrOm, 196w T SMOE FYROT SWTARS! Rl 351

G (3 AT 2oty Tft W pmTESR wow e meg Taerrer w2 s
TiEdtEE, RN, WHe Smaw a9 A

T. ®. W,

foft g = fanre
m?aztmmmmz
(1 TereTsh omel fheweriay X OyRTE YTEs ITAewre
el Uy AHERE 20k T WOR WEE FHET HEHAR)
T ATRfEr, TRTaEdt @ st et sfetiae, tee
amorft e wroareTdt st
wny  wgrendt, AE A EERn umieeioet oEET TRENEEr, AT
“Eﬂmﬁramﬁmwﬂmﬁw LTI umﬁamr@“rqurmam?

T o A mgrarelt, TTRISETEY RS W, AR, §EiE
| wufTa s ﬁ—f a:n% —
o1 s, TERTE O TRYTEET, T dwrmet | SEiTE e T

4
=R (GHTEOT AMETET, Role HE WMIREL

Falvol - =P T RN



HEATEE JITGH 10 BETAHOT VAT =W, AHEET T, 088/ 2F, T 4833

3, TR JREEEl, TR ouEeE = sneifre 9 sfultem,
i V3R (TR AN wAT BRI M AMEEET o oRTER ST FTE),

FEARR ¥o Yreq e 8% Tl —
teg @ () mWeE-med () e —
(@) “Fhe TEGiEd” @ Aegiadeel ST EeTT BRI &
TAEY TS RO T _
(@) “Ete suwimia” o DEgINEas CgEe smeeT w
(%) WEwEE {e) Te—
() “PAT FOOOETT W WegRUES] TR BRIl BUATTET ET
HAEN wMEHA FATOE B ;
() “Sf Emahrdy” @ wespnied Cshd swaimdaT @
w7 jEs 3. OBF HEEEmTEn &80 lee WA, OE-wAn (o) T, —
=1

T
e (4) “FivR FURIEEE” W RGP Uw g TEGEE gl
TRE EEn Wl HMEE FUOE AR

U, () &y wuaEdT” wnawaﬂ“ﬂqﬁﬁww BT HoTRT
THEE  FHITET TEE.

W OWRL ¥, Y FEEEarE e fel THe, dE-wes (3 TeE,—

Futwn (v} “Fhry wogmda” @1 Sepotes “UE BRI S9Eadn &7
e mes DY T RITAM URH

YT (v) *dfe Traie o TepTTmst CoEd wemnda @ T

T OwEe w, TEE HiuTmomen wRdu t¢3 Tde, Tee-wmed (8) o, Y
|l REETE - PR , -

mﬁqmmﬂﬂﬂ”mnﬁw“ﬁmmm’mww
W vo GATHE O
qameEr  TwH

§.3 W

TuT,



TETTR WA VO AETACNT WA T, AGRET ¥, q0v3/u 2¥, ¥ 1233 E

%, W afefener wmem bew wdie, TEehen () R, CwAE FTOAe

T,
wuainda” o FugEET uaw ewitdA”T B OREE TEE SO E#ﬁm

'-’JEF i we
qre
PN
T
W, T SRIYARRT WE R TEM, W@ (3) T, W T ke
AR T AesO0EsT Sqm FEN TRPTEHT §1 TR S gl
WA AR wHF Ao
A, T
2k, T

YT,
¢, W sfalmmren wem ey W, — ) T RAEL
=l ¥ :.-'

(1) dte-werm (%) Ow, ‘y EAN wEamdE” T EEC e R

. g : E i S
T B TOEAA” B eI SEe wIUEE IR T W
5 ot
{3) diE-=ds (o) W, ‘qﬁumﬁ”mnwﬁ*ig
“PAS TATE TYAdd” BT e ARE T e
Q. E AWRITNED W g% WA, TE-me (W) M- e oase
AT

(ﬂwwaa“u'nm@amwﬁﬁm”mawﬁm

O o
e AMEE FER AEe

(%) “dgard suaiade” mwﬁaﬁ“gﬁs’rmmﬁa’%ﬁj
F TAE TEe wOUHE dge

Qo. WEH FMfEmEm e (%3 mdiE, gE-wed (3) we— mw oaew
TR
(2) “TEFt FUGEE? @ AREeN T YO FER TOEiedd #1 s

WO vo
TR W FIERT T —

(%}"ﬁaaﬂaﬁqﬁqﬂ#’mmaﬁﬁ"ﬁ#ﬂmmhﬁ#’w%

F AL wEE FETEE EEE.

v, TR SREEENT $OW WY THR, TESEEA (3) M, — 79
o TENTE

(2) “oraet TRt 4 TRETUES SUte gWN ERAiTEe” g s

WEE we
TEGY GTES FOOR WA

TN e
(3) “TF TUDMET W SAEIUEST S wTagda” w

Ry CHI
HHET e
TEw Lo AEE

£l



o HERTS Ve AT RATGTIU WP WE, A 2F, zote/die vy, T 1339

T OWRL g3 T eufremnem wew geE mad, Cmwre eTeiuda” oar

HqT TR i n .
whehgn TOGUNET CUTRSl BEAHET @ Aegt §REE (TR G,

=k o

AT wET
7%y, Wt

TR T g3, mgun sfuframrem ®wmR Yo meE, oiz-wmem (3) el -
iferfien (0 " wwETdE” @ gegmes Cre FeR RTEiTET g
PET R uigd GREel VAT el

a7 & (%) “sgr TI@lcda” #1 TwEmEWt VWO FUATEAT BT AT

CpEr I s e T

oL W Ry, TN ANCEHmET #eE e I, JRE-wmme (30 mE,
;ﬁwmmmgwmﬁmﬁﬁmm
rte vo TF TAR E@TGA A WS g geweEh B e anfm

mer sew HE Feeidd WIVATE ] OlEedredT aredid, deer s i
Wo I g ReRfwET, W g v, #W SeeEd soad 9
mﬂﬁﬂmmﬁm&mwmﬁmmm

sl e wRET W ey Tae s

T OGRe W jw, I FRATETe weH Y17 TTHie. We-wwmm (7)) R
mﬂimmﬂwmmﬁmﬁﬁ#’mﬂmﬂw
i o BW EAN FUATTER WY ¢ wodl sendort e ge e

men wms HEL OHTATd T Ofeeder wedm, ofemr smew fom smemmem
WA o, T A e, el wvgT W (R T s
EEET FT TSR qiEe oA Heel,

woREs W R, DT SUTIEETSR ER 0 3Rk HMiE -

i () He-wem (¥ T,y semwdn” o1 AeRpOUEs tus

PR v WAL wnaiRt @ SeET TEW wEean oder
o7 F=HT

SR () M=z-wem (s 7, T wwriwded o owg e



AERTS T TAYS SEGOT IPT 9R, AR 2%, Jov/dW o, Y venR .

to. T sfufrgorem Hem e WU, diE-wem (3) e, w9 e W
‘I FTETEET W REgOUEW] TR PR TEimEn T REgE e

. Ffufamm
TEA FTAE HEA, A
T ®wFH
CLUER
AL
. VEH HUTTAAremr Em it W, ORE-Fem (3 Wed,— 89 e W
. " HETTE
() ‘e Togimde”? @ wegpImEe Curew wUaude 8 gpeen
Mgt TTmer wovam 4 wHE o
*1 [ av m m
(%) “wrg FRATR’ w mergTEes Cwra swatdeT oo
TET TREE HOOOm AAE. e

3. TA Fiufszoremr wem 33t mftw, dE-wmEE (%) W W e @
“oEre TiwdE” @ TeRUER Ctoredl TTaidd o8 TR e TR
wvam WHE. il

wahE ye
e We
13
Liens

go. TR FTAGATEN ®OW wRy THRE, GE-EEE () AW, CCEW W e v
AR FOEiedE’ W FREAGEA YT R arew T g Aoy WS
ar LT e 1 m’”i"'“:n

ey W

wav ot

L
¥, I FUTTERrE wEE wRe e, dE-wem () o - T ey W

(O omrE Twmigdn Y g wNpIE o TeR sl e e

wiwfres
WY STAET ®UTEE O o
(2) w1 Fomimds ™ 91 FoERTEE vy Fwaidd g TR T e
TR TIUOTT O 396 ot
d . S
%%, T afFaursdn wEm 3ve TR, TE-wAR (3 ed — Haq vene. AT
(23 ™ urTge] TEETIHT T OH] WIS U gy STAET R R
. - - AT
Hadgy ey h{TONT =T - _
. . - .. . FATE 4c
(21 " UEETE Emadn TOW WA AT TEIE wAMAA T o
BT Tuidpi tHEV FITOTN TR S T
ST



g TETE AR TG AT UTT 9, AFEEL T, vety/ U vy, WF 1R

T mEL WYY, W AlUTATOrET wE Y3 T, —
T (%) Te-werm () owl, * EvR TumiwT T ow wetesi s

g qo | FNE TOAMTET T BT IR ITEGT FA0AE AN ;

AT T (2) dSte-wmem (%) e, CfoFoy FTEYET T oA Aegeasr (o ue
WR g R R WS STEE HRITATT dEeT
LIRS

TSR W %Y. R AT SEH 3o g, U ¥aY FOEieda 3 wdin
ﬁmmmiﬁﬁ?ﬁﬁf‘ﬂwﬁéﬂaﬁmmm F¥oUTe e THEeaTeal
HT a;; FEATE e FAE g sewr=sy) RAEmTEA, s ouedw fmavl, ad
3o o FEL FIOHTE AW TR 1 URE e e v s
w3 VbS] GOOET SomRar PR gidel T @1 O Sas wegn el

ARG W W, A AMEEEAT e I3t O —
AR {1y * wive TomiEm " A1 OAgInEs U TE g wwamda Toar

o TOTRT STEE AT T
o (3) " o\ T o megted Y FramAT T o' we
A gEEer ST AEEl
T
T owe, W ¥R, T suiAmETE w339 mudied, —
Hﬁ,! : () oz wem (30 med, el ETTET oW mergamies o
T4aH s e . -
_— Sl hUA1IES # Welpd =hEoe] Hran T35 ;
e R (%) dle-FAT (w) WA, WE (@) WE, U Rl FEEE YT

W A TSl gE] g BTATTRE W TeRRY IEE I dde

1

W owRe W 9. OEg AUETOTEN SeE 23y W, e sueide

AR AU T BT SEEOOT & Ml JHdel BT g
AT '

41

A go
AT kel
7y o
T, . - . .
e orene o R4, TUFT ATETOEFRT FERT 43R Rffol, Wid-shodu [3) HRT —
HETT (%) * TR ETATHR T Al HeGAnEE] U @elld ST TR
. g, TVET T TR HEE

r

=N FEH (31 el AumiTRE T oW m‘,r “ I TR 8T B

2In W SIEE FITENT :1—-—[\\
T



TR FINA 7T SRTERT T W, AR vy, vore/uhy 3w, T R K

%, T sfafaAeTET W s HHi, A TREL S
TR

(2) Te-mFem (1) W, -
() " TeamE T o mergnEe < g9 AR FUArTd T ami v

7 UET TIEe HOvEw OE T‘:‘f‘*
r 3 - = r L ¥ Kk
(@) “ o FUETEE " W A M TR FHAET T A ey
THAET YA HITHE W
() de-HAE () TH,—
(F) v g wOmiTHE A1 Fee e EAET §9R
SIS 7 B HAFT SrEel wIvEE g
() TS AT A Ao e T toa
TRy ATEe A =T
3o, ET ISR Hem Ve i, dE-FE () i, TED W taRn @
FUmiEA T A A AEAT I FIEIEE T OE AT qree WT
ﬂ‘:—"{ 'ﬂ-'.q."ﬂ-'. e
=] ST
v Ft
QLT

3R, OET SRR Fe yul ol 9w (3 A Rl T ReR
weETTEe T A e W FeN eTdiTd g1 HErgi et AT
AT
wHH Ao
AT FeTH
e o
THETE,

37, o AARTIOOR e 3w FR, WE-wEE (W) W TR AT TRER
Foide A1 TErETIGES T FEY FHOTOH T Tei S R

TR TE. -

AT T
3uy ot
B cnand

HL T It

3. HEA SO T 23 T, el () ma cEEE TR T
el FTETTHE A HERRATES G EWw aTat S s T TR AT
. FOR £e WL
Rrfed T TRl e
AT



AERTE JIEFT TG SATTAH WY 9, AR {2, jove/d 38, Wk 2879
WAk W 3%, gEd NTmTem wem ey e, de-wers (30 e, waT
AR ugimdea o1 gergOnEs] v UE FAR SUATTEG R HEgT JREE
o FUOAR e,
em
suy of
oL

TR M Fu, T HUEIETEN FHEH ey WA,
ot : () TiE-Fod () WA, “OE sYaiEa Ay rerpAwE o areE
e o | SUAHEE T W TAFT ITEE HITOT TR ;

e (3) We-wont (3) WA, - ¥R FEETEE T a7 meeeEs

TEY = i 7 Yoo,
waowen W 3%, Hem AffAEOEnr wem vEe o, TR-Fes () T —
AERT (V) “ R wTETE oW OegEst C U g s oA
HAHL THE T SEE
HIEH o ®l ) _ o
e w=E (Y) “ ¥ FUEigEw W A 0w AN s TE

o W HOTRT UTHE HIVATY AEE
. (3) " UwE TOE O Oeigemes C wEsl w9l T §F SRl aTEd
AT dERT
(%} “EET @ AT HerpAUES ¢ giad Hwd T FT O] ATE
LA A
TITRen W Y, T FMEFROTEN O IR TEHE, de-wed (9 meE, e
WY pomiadd oA OeE el UE AR swEiede T YT IhEe
W“ FITIT AEE
WHT o
Hred] e
AR
T,
g vegn o ¥, HET wWUO@OTeT wEW vwy TS, O92-wEw (3) T e

TR FURiTAE ¢ O HSTRIEE WS FOEE AT WA SRS St
safmm

. Elﬂrt-l.
wmaOE ¥
e Twen

Ta%

I,



TERTY YTEA AT HATTGROT W GW, THAET 0y, 3ote/d 2%, Wk 1%3%

I I AUAEEE @™ Yex WM, TiZ-eH (3) TW,—  m peew
(2) " ol FOOHEE AW TApImae o ure g euaidde mi.m@
Bt O oTEd Th{THRT éI"fg:Fl': THTE do

() “UAH FUHGHR " @ A Iidel t uray Hugiade v ogp el wRE

x Ty =
O TFEd T AE,
T,
wo. W Afufaonrest #om ey iR, dtE-wmerm (3) Wed,— W R W
(2) “ O Pt C @ ST YW Fe SR o
T TP SREE wITOE WEA = vo
() “wEra wUEiEAT U AT FAFLOCOS]  OrEy pemimRid gy e e
TAFL FTEA FRogm dder gy T
F[':EIT*TI'I'
¥Q. T WiOOTeRl werH Ywh WHiE, 9E-med (3) med— e m
(*) “wTaet FumiTdn " W AeIgETES g FAN EWATEE T
€ TS TEC] SR e ; dl " ”:v
(3) “UAE FUEOdaE T AT WelgImee o arerdt seEreda v g7 e we
%7 AFEw FI0ORT dEel 255 Ht
T,

¥ T Hfufmmar +em Yo AR, TE-FHH (30 9 om w9 ey
o - e r ] : TRt

ZE FAN TOITEA A YRR soedl geddwrdat frpar e anfnm o y
IeiTa YT =] TeegTe AEdd TI sy fEw S gem e
e, =0 wetE et se T I e o 9t oo vae
TodF WARTAE] WORE FiT FTWEE vy TRRAT SOeRdl gEaemTey
Fmed1 #1E1 #1 OWEY ZREeT HIUOi fel

¥3. W FMTETEQ e vot B, UE-®om (7)) M .. B EREe W

(7) “ AW FUEIGEA T A TR oA ST HWE?W

BHEA WHTTAE UE FTiw co
(2} " T FUEGHT T W TAGIMEF oWl FOAdd T gl AeiEy TR

] ] . wa® T
AT AT Ager. N
FaT

¥¥. OEy AFEOTEN FO Yce THRA, ute-wmorm (3) W, — T LRRe @

(%) = TP BOAIGHA T A IS W g swEeedn L
&1 Hefeh? TUEH T e FUE 4o

L

(3) v usma wBwmigdd t oA OEpUEt Oy s e TN we

. Ja0 S
HRT AT AT W )
T



o

T IRy AT
T
Hhafrmy
T o
eI
zet Ht
FRAO.
T e, =T
AT
wfufmm
FHIF §o
TN F
CTAN |
FLET,

T RREL T
R
haae
L
HET wA D
ELHI
TETTOT,

=

HA 1Rl =
TETr e
Hred==m
TS £
RH HEE ET T
w40 Tt
'F[H’l?ﬂ'!'f.

WA §TEL AT
T
T
HIME ra
Ol AT
g o

R

TEETS FIRA TRAT 3T 90T 91, AFERT 9%, Fott iy 3w, YR el

x4, i Afufmmer wen e mEE, de-wem (3) meE,—
(2) TR TTAITEA W AeemE S AR FEEE TR
HEHT ATE] AT A ;
{3) o9 TURMHEE T W HSE S SIEiET g Tein
TREE TEE 9.
WE. TE AT wer el mete, WE-sed (3) we,
“aragt FTATRE T W oegotesl U O g wwarmid oo
WARL  aTEA Rl R

¥s. T whfHooEEmn wem 38y mRE —
(1) wE-FAR (1) A —

(7Y wWE (vF; meE, CdEw wwmdE T @i gaE I
M o T e i - IR BT W s B T o L O
() == (I med, Cargd FEiTE T om werges
(%) cte-a@au (3) Hue, dD (F) O, Tt st T
WM OMEAESS CAE AN T THAiden T BT WAEY WRde
AR 7—13%"[

¥&. T wMulAdmen &R 3%3 O, e
(a} ?g-g ':ﬂ-r} qﬂj" “ '-‘?'i"lil':f E i JE:T-\ ” k2| i :"-1-'{ [\]_f]\.ﬂ- “.I'-'_a-_"
AN HUAMEE T F WAEL EWEG wA0An AT
{2 ®@% (77 W, AT pgEa T @ meeeEmEst g
TR urt ewiida gl WoigE RPES ST S
W e afldaursdr @ 3%y OuR, TE-me (V) A,
oy ETEET T W OmEe T oravt FeEn U OB AerEd



HERTE TR 707 SETET WP 9W, AHER 2y, ot/ iy vy, W 13y %

Lo, IET D wEE 2w, de-wem () meE, wEowns
U TwEET T A meglest Cuw eR FTEES e weer T

FHIER te
AT HHA
%, =y
T

wt T HufmmEmm e e wmiiE, diewem (8) ome, owm teku

I e R oy e I Tl o R - i
i
TREE  HFI0HET AEe.

FHE %o
ar=A] e
IR o
e,
w3, g sifufaomrem w3 T — FA 13EL o1
(0 TR wmAda T A TegEmEs U RR ST T e
Bl WY SEe] TR A wAE 1o
, " s . AT FATA
() “mm wmETEn T W GelpudEst tyhe s e seq &
HAGET TRAT VAR Odel. S

w3 T sfufmmem wEw 3o ma et A TR T oA mEs A
mﬂﬁ?ﬂﬁaﬁ“:ﬁmmm@"mwaﬁmﬁmﬂ;ﬂ;@
A g

1 FHIw ho
T T
3oo

e,

1 BEIRALF 08 WOVERNMENT PHINTING, STATIUNERY A%11 PUBLICATINN, PRIMNTED AN FUELISHED 3y S PATESH L AN
JACANKATH  ROSAVI. PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT UFNTEAL PIESS. 1A, SETAJ SEEILSIE KOWAL), CILARNT 1Al
MUMEAD x4 ANL MUELIREED AT HESTIHATE 0 GOV ERNAEST BHIN TN, STATIINERY AND PUHLICATION 914,
NETAI STRHASH ROADY CIRAKNT JOAIL AUMHALD 300 ot EDITOR SA PAUSHUEAM JAGANKATH G5



HETEXOT HIT ATS

N 3, AF w¥] AT, AR 0%, 3028/ 2%, Fidh 2%3% [ges o, firorer . wad 22 00

AETETUT EHE 3
| arfirEs e
ey frarrieatd sfufiay @ eauTeAT AR e seEaw 7 Fas faftou
whr frft 7 —arn fawrrage eEel Rodad (dusit weeR.

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagur Pancheyats and
Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2010 (Msh. Act No. Tof 2011). is hereby publisl:ed
under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharaszhira,

H. B. PATEL,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. I OF 2011.

(First published, ofter having received the assent of the Governor, in
the “ Mahure itra Government Gazetle ” on the 14th January 2011),
An Act furthey ‘o amend the Maharashira Municipal Councils,
Nagur Panchaya.s and Industrial Townships Act, 1963,

Mah.  WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashira
AL of Mymicipal Councils, Nagar Punchayats and Industrial Townships Act,
1965, o . . . - _
1965, for the purpeses hercinafter appearing; it is heoreby enacted in
the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India, as follows :—
1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Short title.
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2010,

2. In section 179 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Negar Ameadment

Mah. Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1963 (hereinafter referrad of soct .

XL of {g as “the principal Act™),— eSS :‘}é

1965. {1} in sub-secticn (2} — Al O o
f«) for the words “one hundred rupees” the words “one

thousand rupees “shall be substituted ;
{2)




-

Amendment

of gection
120 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendment

of gection
181 of Meh.
XL of 1964,

Amendment

of section
183 af Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendnent

of section
185 of Mah.
X1 of 1985,

Amendment
of zection
188 of Mah.
Xi. of 1965,
Amendment
of section

188 of Mah
XL of 1965

Amendmernt

of section
192 of Mah.
XL of 19865.

Amendment

of zection
193 of Mah.
XL of 1985.

WERTS G ToT0R SFETHRTT Wi 308, SIERT Y, SoR¢/WN 3%, W 2R3I0

(b} for the words * twenty rupees ™ the words “ iwo hundred
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

{2) in sub-seclion (8),—

() for the words “onc hundred rupees” the words “one
thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(b} for ihe words “iwenty rupees” the words “ twe hundred
rupees ~ shall be substituted.

3. In section 180 of the principal Aci, in sub-section (73—

(1) for the words “ one hundred rupees " the words “ one thousand
rupees ” shall be substiiuted ;

(2) for the words “twenty rupeces” the words “two hundred
rupees ” shall be substituted.

4. In section 181 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—

{1} for the words “ one hundred rupees ” the words “ one thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

L

(2) for the words “twenty rupses” the words “iwo hundred

rupees ” shall be substituted.

5. In section 183 of the principal Act, in sub-section (6), for the
words “ one thousand rupees ” the words “ ten thousand rupees ” shall
be substituted.

6. In section 185 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words “fifty rupees” the words “five hurdred rupees” stail be
substituted.

7. 1In section 186 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), for the
words * one hundred rupees ” the words “ one thousand rupees " shall
be substituted.

8. In section 189 of the principal Act,—

17) 1n sub-section {9}, for the words “five thousand rupees.” the
words © fifty thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(2} in sub-section (I0), for the words “twanty-five rupees” the
words “ two hundred and fifty rupees ” shall be substituted.
9. Im section 192 of the principal Act, in sub-section {(5},—
(1) for the words “ one hundred rupees ” the words “ one thousand
rupees ~ shall be substituted ;

(2) for the words * twenty-five rupees ” the words “ two hundred
and fifty rupees ” shall be substituted.

10.

{1} for the words “ five hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

in seetion 193 of the prineipal Act, in sub-section (3}, —

(2) for the words “ twenty-five rupees ” the words “ two hundred
and fifty rupees "shall be substituted.



TG, IMET TS JTHIT WIT @, FER] 0¥, 208/WY 2%, W 2]IR

11. Tn section 194 of the principal Act, in sub-section {(2),—

(1) for the words “ five hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand
rupees " shall be substituted ;

(2) for the words “ten rupees ” the words “ one hundred rupees
shall be substituted.

12. 1In section 196 of the principal Act, for the words “ fifty rupees ”
the words “ five hundred rupees ” shall be substituted.

C13.

(I} for the words “ one hundred rupees
rupees " shall be substituted ;

(2) for the words “ten rupees” the words * one hundred rupees ™
shall be substituted.

14. In section 210 of the principal Act, in sub-seciion (3), for the
words “ one hundred rupees ” the words “ one thousand rupees, and in
the case of continuing offence with further fine which may extend to
one hundred rupees for every day after the first during which such
contravention continues ” shall be substituted.

15. In section 211 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words “ one hiundred rupees ” the words “ one thousand rupees, and in
the case of continuing effence with further fine which may extend to
one hundred rupees for every day after the first during which such
contravention continues " shall he substituted.

16. In section 215 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section {2), for the words “one hundred rupees ” the words
“ one thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

In section 202 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3j——
¥ the words * one thousand

(2) in sub-section (7), for the words “ three hundred rup]aes ” the
words “ three thousand rupees " shail be substituted.

17. Insection 216 of the principal Act, in sub-section {2), for the words
“one hundred rupees ” the words “ one thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

18. In section 217 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), —

]

(1} for the words * fifty rupees " the words five hundred rupees
shall be substituied ;

{2} for the words “ five rupees
substituted.

19. In section 221 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), for the words
“ fifty rupees ” the words “ five hundred rupees ” shall be substituted.

" the words “ fifly rupees ” shall be

20. In section 224 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words
“two hundred and fifty rupees” the words “twe thousand and five
hundred rupees ” shall be substituted,

3

Amendment
of section

184 of Mah.
XL of 1965,

Armendment
of section

196 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendmens
of section

202 of Mah.
XL of 196a.

Amendment
of section

210 of Mah.
Xi. of 1965.

Amendment
of section

231 of Mah
XL of 1965,

Amendment
of section

215 of Mah,
X1i: of 1965,

Amandmen:
of section

216 of Mah.
XL, of 1865.

Amendment
of section

217 of Mak.
XL of 1963.

Amendment
of section

221 of Mah.
Xi of 18635,

Amendment
of scction

224 of Mah.
X1, of 1965,



k1

Amendment

of section
228 of Mah.
X, of 1965,

Amendment

of sectinn
227 of Mah.
Xi. of 16835,

Amendment

of section
229 of Mah
¥1. af 1963.

Amendment

of section
220 of Mah.
¥, of 1945.

Amendment

of seciion
231 of Mah.
AL of 196b.

Amendment

of section
232 of Mah.
XL of 1963.

Amendment

of section
233 of Mah
XL of 1865,

Amendmont

of zectien
236 of Mah.
XL, of 1965

Amendment

of section
246 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

TERTE WA TSN IR W A0S, THAHT ¥, 208¢/WW 26, W IR

21. In section 226 of the principal Act, in sub-seciion (2), —

]

(1) for the words “fifty rupees " the words “ five hundred rupees’
shall be subsiituted ;

{2} for the words “ ten rupees ” the we=ds “ one hundred rupees ”
shall be substituted.
22. -In scciion 227 of the principal Act, int sub-section (2), —

(1) for the words “ five hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand
rupees ” shall be substiluted ; '

17} for the words “ twenty-five rupees ” the words “ two hundred
arw Hfty rupees " shall be substituted.
23, In section 229 of the principal Act, —

{27 in sub-section {1), for the words “ one hunered rupees " the
words “ one thousand rupecs " shall be snbstituted ;

(2} in sub-section (2), for the words “ one hundred rupees ” the
words “ one thousand rupees ” shall be substituted.

24. Insection 230 of the principal Act, for the words “ one hundred

rupees ” the words “ one thousand rupees, and in the case of continuing
offence with further fine which mav extend to one hundred rupees for
every day after the first during which such contravention continues ” shall
be substituted.

23. In section 231 of the principal Act, —

(1) for the words “ onc hundred rupees ™ the words © one thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(2) for the words “ twenty rupees " the words ™ two hundred rupecs ”
shall be substituted.

26, In section 232 of the principal Act, —

{11 in sub-section {3), for the words “ on¢ hundred rupees ” the
words “ one thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(21 in sub-section (4), in clause (b}, for the words “ one thousand
rupees ” the words “ ten thousand rupees ” shall be substituted.

27. In section 233 of the principal Act, for the words “ one hundred

rupecs " the words “ one thousand rupees ” shall be substituted.

28, Insection 236 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2},

(%; {or the words “ one hundred rupees " the words “ onc thousand
rupecs " shall be substituied ;

(2) for the words “ten rupees ” the words * ene hundred rupees”
shall be substituted.
29, Insection 246 of the principal Aet,—

{1} in sub-section {1}, —

(@) for the words™ two hundred rupees ” the words “ two thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted ;



TERTS WS TR FETCRIT W MG, FAAT 08, 0R/TW ¥, T 1R

() for the words “ twenty rupees ” the words “ two hondred
rapees ” shall be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (2},—
(a) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “ten
thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;
(b) for the words * fifty rupees ” the words * five hundred rupees ”
ghall be substituted. :
30. In section 248 of the principal Act, in sub-gection (5), for the words
“ fon rupecs ” the words “one hundred rupees ” shall be substituted.

31. In section 251 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3}, for the words
“ five hundred rupces ” the words “ five thousand rupees ” shall be
substituted,

39. In section 252 of the principal Act, in sub-section {(5), for the words
“ five hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand rupees ” shall be
substituted.

23, In section 253 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), for the
words * two hundred and fifty rupees ” the words “ two thousand and
five hundred rupees " shall be substituted.

34, In section 254 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words “ one bondred rupees ” the words “ one theusand rupees ” shall
bi: substituied.

35. In section 265 of the principal Act,—

1) in sub-zection (1), for the words “fifty rupees” the words
“five hundred rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “ one hundred rupees” the
words “ane thousand rupees ” shall be substituted.
36. In seciion 267 of the principal Act, in sub-section {(2),—

(1) for the worde “ five hundred rupees * the words “ five thousand
rupees ” shail be substituted ;

(2) for the words “ onc hundred rupees " the words “ one thousand
rupees " shall be substituted ;

i3) for the words “ fifty rupees " the words “ five hundred rupees ”
shall be substituted ;

(4) for the words * ten rupees ” the words “ one hundred rupees ”
shall be substituted.

37 In section 269 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words “ one bundred rupees ” the words “ one thousand rupees ” shall
be substituted.

Amendment
of section

249 of Mah.
XL of 1985.

Amendment
of section

251 of Mah.
XL of 1985

Amendment
of section

252 of Mah.
X1, of 1963,

Amendment
of section

253 of Mah
XL of 1965.

Amendment
of section

254 of Mah.
XL of 1865

Amendment
of section

265 of Mah.
XL of 1663,

Amendment
of section

267 of Mah.
X1, of 1865.

Amendment
of section

268 of Mah.
XL of 1965.



Amendment

of section
272 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendment

of section
274 of Mah.
XL of 1963.

Amendment

of section
275 of Mah.
XL, of 1965.

Amendment

of seetion
276 of Mah.
X1 of 1965.

Amendment

_of section
278 of AMah.
XL of 1865.

Amendment

of section
279 of Mah.
XL, of 1963,

Amendment

of seciion
280 of Mah.
XL of 1463,

Amendment

of section
281 of Makh.
X1, of 1965,

TERTY W TATT HATERWT WU 308, WA U%, 08R/91W 2%, 98 23%?

38. In section 272 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3}, for ihe

words “fifty rupces” the words “five hundred rupees™ shall be
substituted.

39. In section 274 of the principal Act, in sub-section {3),—

(I} for the words “ five hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

]

(2} for the words © fifty rupees ” the words “ five hundred rupees’
shall be substituted.
40. In section 275 of the principal Act, in sub-section £33, --

(I} forthe words “ five hundred rupees ” the words * five thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(2} for the words “ fifty rupees ” the words “ five hundred rupees’
shall be substituied.

41. In section 276 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—

(1} for the words “five hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(2) for the words “ fifty rupees ” the words “ five hundred rupees *
shall be substituted.

42. 1In scetion 278 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the

words “ one thousand rupees ” the words “ten thousand rupees, and
in the case of continuing offerice with further fine which may extend
to one thousand rupees for every day afier the first during which such
contravention continues ” shall be substituted.

43. In section 279 of the principal Act, in sub-section. (2} —

(1) for the words “ fifty rupees ” the words “ five hundred rupees ”
shall be substituted ;

(2) for the words  five rupees ” the words “ fifty rupees * shall be
substituted.

44 1In section 280 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—

{1} for the words “ {ive hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand
rupees ” shall be substituied ;

{2) for the words “ fifty rupees ” the words “ five hundred rupees ”
shail be substituted.

45. In section 281 cof the principal Act, in sub-seetion (3),—

(1} for the words “ two hundred rupees ” the words “ twe thousand
rupees " shall be substituted ;

£

(2) for the words “twenty rupees” the words “two hundred

rupees ~ shall be substituted.



PRI TR TG FETET 90 A, SHAT 0¥, 08/ Y, I 2R L
46. In section 285 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), for the Amendrment
words * five hundred rupecs ” the words “ five thousand rupees ” shall ?,f&;e;';"g?ah
be substituted. XL of 1965.
47. In section 291 of the principal Act,— Amendment
of section
{1Y in sub-section (1),— 281 of Mah.
XL of 1965,
() in clause {0), for the words “threc hundred rupees” the
words “ three thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;
(&) in clause (i), for the words * five hundred rupees” the
words “ five thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;
(%} in sub-section {2), in clause (a), for the words “ twe hundred
and fifty rupees” the werds “two thousand and five hundred
rupees ” shall be substituted.
48. In section 292 of the principal Act,— Amendment
of section
202 of Mah.

{I) in clause (a). for the words “cne hundred rupees ” the words
“ one thousand rupees ” shiall be substituted ;

(2Yin clause (b), for the words © twa hundred and fifty rupees " the
words “ two thousand and five hundred rapees ” shall be substituted.

49. In section 291 of the principal Act, in sub-section {2}, for the
words “1ifty rupees” the words “five hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.

50. In seciion 285 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
wHrds © one hundred rupees " ihe words “ one thousand rupees " shall
+ 5 zubstituted.

31, Ip section 296 of the principal Act, in sub-seetion (6}, for the
words “ five hundred rupees ” the words “ five thousand rupees ” shall
be substituted.

52, In section 299 of the principal Act, —

(1) for the words “ one hundred rupees " the words “ one thousand
rupees " shall be substituted ;

{2) for the words “ten ru pecé ” the words “ one hundred rupees ”
shall he substituted.

53. In section 300 of the prinecipal Act, for the words “ two hundred
and fifty rupees ” the words “ two thousand and five hundred rupees *
shall be substituted. '

XL of 1985.

Amendment
af section

294 of Mah.
XL of 1985.

Amendment
of section

295 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendment
of section
218 of Mah.

- XL of 1963.

Amendment
of section

299 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendment
of section

300 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

0N BEHALE OF GOVERNAMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PULBLICATION, PRINTED AND PURLISHED BY
SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ[ SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNT
ROAD, MUMBAT 400 004 ANT) PUBLIEHED AT MRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING. STATICNERY AND PUBLICATION,
217, NETAJL SUBHASH RBOAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAT 480 004, EDITOR - STRI PAREHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVE



