o 3, 3w ¥E ()] TR, fedsT ¢, YoR0/ATFTIUT R9, WH 23R fu e
f&pme : ¥OF ¢R.00

2TATIRUT HHI® R0

I V
wERTE Rremdzere sfufam 9 woawent weEfd wed gwmRw w wee e
afir fafr & =g frurmeega wrdet fems (Fw srE).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Municipal Councils

(Third Antendment) Act, 2010 (Mah, Act No. XXVII of 2010, is hereby published under the
authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,
H. B. PATEL,

Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXVII OF 2010.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor, in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ” on the 18th December 2010.)

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act,
the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City
of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 and the Maharashira Municipal
Councils; Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in
session

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied
that circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to
T EE—oy C®

.



3 TR T TRTA SARTLHTT 41T 3703, TEHGT 3¢, 2080/ ATFTAV 719, b Q3%

take immediate action further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation Act, the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act,
1949, the City of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats snd Industrial Townsghips Act,
1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; and therefore,
promulgated the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2010, on the 2nd August 2010 and the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Municipal Councils
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2010, on the 26th August 2010,

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordincnces by
a consolidated Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India as follows :(—

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

Short title 1. 71) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal
and Corporations and Municipal Councils (Third Amendment) Act, 2010.

commence-

ment, (2) (i) Sections 1, 10 and 12 of this Act shall be deemed to have come
into force on the 2nd August 2010.

(i) Sections 2 to 9, 11 and 13 to 19 of this Act shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 26th August 2010.

CHAPTER 1I _
AMENDMENTS TO THE MUMBAI MUNiciPAL CORPORATION ACT

Amendment 9 Tpn gection 128 of the Mumbai ? Municipal Corporation Act

of nggor} (hereinafter, in this Chaptar, referred to as “the Mumbai Corporation

Bom. Il of Act™)—
1888. (1) in sub-section (7), in c.lause ()~

(@) for the words “official year; and ” the words “ofﬁ(:lal year: ”
shall be substituted ,
(b) the following proviso shall be addvd namely ~—
“Provided that, the Corporation may determine different
rates of property taxes for different categories of users of a
building or land or part thereof; and ” ;
(2) after sub-section (2), the following sub- sc.ctwn shall be added,
namely :—
“3) \'otw1thstandmg any thing contained in sub-sections (1) dnd
(2), the Corporation may at any time, after the 26th August 2010,

Bom.
JIT of
1888.
Bom.
LIX of
1949.
C. P
and
erar
II of
1950.
Malh.

XL of -

1965,
Mah.
Ord.

IX of
2010.

Mah.
Ord. X
of
2010.

Bom.
I1I of
1888,

" .




HETTE VT TS0 ST ST A8, Fawiay w6, R020/arerant 26, Wk 1]3% SR

being the date of the commencement of section 2 of the

Mah. Maharasitra Municipal Corporations and Municipal Councils (Third
XX\;IOII gf Amendment) Act, 2010, but before the expiry of the official year

2010-2011 (hereinafter, in this Act, referred to as “the year 2010-
20117, determine different rates of property taxes for differeni
categories of users of a building or land or part thereof, which
may be lived in the year 2010-2011. The rates of properiy taxes
so determined shall be effective and shall be decmed to have
been effective from the 1st April 2010 and the tax during the
year 2010-201 1 shall be leviable and payable at those rates.”.

3. Scction 140A of the Mumbai Corporation Act shall be re- Amendment
numbered as sub-section (1) thereof; and after sub-section (1), as so of seclion

re-numbered, the following sub-sections shall be added, namely :— Eﬁf ;Irl of

_ “(2) Notwithstanding anything cpontained in sub-section (4) of 18ss.
section 139A or any other provisions of this Act or Resolution, if
any, passed by the Corporation for adopting the levy of property tax
on buildings and lands on the basis of capital value, but subject to
the provisions of section 154A, buildings and lands in respect of
which the process of fixing capital value is in progress on the 26th
August 2010, being the date of coming into force of section 3 of the

Mah.  Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Munricipal Councils (Third

XXVIL of  Amendment) Act, 2010, but before fixing the capital value thereof,

2010. the tax leviable and payable in respect of such buildings and lands

ghall provisionally be equal to the amount of tax leviable and payable

in the preceding year, that is to say, for the year ending on the

thirty-first day of March 2010 ; and on fixation of capital value of

such buildings and lands during the year 2010-2011, a final hill

based on the final asseszsment shall be issued for the total tax

leviable and payable during the year 2010-2011. After such final

assessment, if it is found that the assessee has paid excess amount,

such excess amount shall, notwithstanding anything contained in

gection 179, be refunded within three months from the date of

issuing the final bill, along with interest from such date as provided

. in the first proviso to sub-section (5) of section 217, or after obtaining

the consent of the assesee shall be adjusted towards payment of

property tax due, if any, or for the subsequent year; and if the

amounnt of tax on final assessment is more than the amount of tax

{ already paid by the agsessee the difference shall be recovered from
the assessee. :

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 163 or 217 or
any other provisions of this Act and having regard to the fact that
the prorerty tax bill has been issued in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (2), not being a final bill, such bill shall not
be questioned before any forum ; and no complaint or appeal shall
lie against such bill merely on the ground that capital value in
respect of the property which is the subject matter of the bill is not
yvet fixed, or that the amount of tax leviable and payable at the rate
of the property tax determined by the Corporation is not yet finally
ascertained, or on any other ground whatever.”.

AR #ig—4o-t3




¥ . TR WA YIRS STHTERIT W 38, fEHa 26, voRo/AWEHTT 20, Tith (IR

Amendment 4. To section 144A of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the following

of section. Explanation shall be added, namely :—
144A of
Bow. Il of “ Kxplanation.— For the purposes of this section, “ ecologically

1838, heneficial scheme " includes rain water harvesting sysiem, vermi
composting, use of solar energy and other non-conventional sources
of energy, recycling and re-use of waste water, or any scheme for
prometing envivonment friendly and ecologically beneficial building
consiructicn or the like as the Corporation or the State Government
may identify. ”. ‘ :

Amendment 5. In section 154 of the Mumbai Corporation Act,—
ofetion (1) in sub section (1A)- |
Bom. IIT of (@) after the words and figures ¥ the Bombay Stamp Act,
1888. 18568 the words “ as base value, ” shall be inserted ;

(b for the words * taking into consideration the market value
of such building or land, as a base value ; and also have regard
to the following factors namely . —" the words *taking into
consideration the market value of such building or land, as a
base value. The Commissioner, while fixing the capital value as
aforesaid, shall also have regard to the following factors,
namely :—” ghall be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (IB), for the words “ assigned to various such
categories 7 the words “ assigned to various such factors and
categories ” shall be substituted.

Insertion of 6. After section 154 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the following

section 1544 gartion shall be inserted, namely . —
in Bows 11T
of 1888.

Provisional “154A. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 154, where
fixation of in yespect of any building or land or part thereof, the process of
V;ﬂ:ﬂ fixing capital value for the year 2010-2011 is in progress on the 26th
certain  August 2010, being the date of coming into force of section 6 of the
cases.  Maharashtra Municipal Corporation’s and Municipal Councils (Third
Amendment) Act, 2010, the rateable value of such building or land
or any part thereof during the year preceding the year 2010-2011
+  shall be the provisional capital value and shall be deemed to be the
capital value validly and legally fixed under the provisions of this
Act, pending fixing the final capital value thereof; and it shall be
lawful for the Commissioner to treat it as such for the purposes of
- assessment book kept under the provisions of this Act, and the bill
of property lax issued under sub-gection (2) of section 140A shall be
deemed to have been validly and legally issued under the provisions

of this Act. "

Amendment 7. In scction 156 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, for the words

of ‘;;gz";‘r “ prescribe by rules ” the word “ determine * shall be substituted.
Bom. HI of
. 1888.

Mah.
XXVII
of
2010.




ey

REWTZ, TR A0S FATLTCCT ¥TT 3775, FeTaT 3¢, RoRo/ TR 219, T8 RI3R

8. In section 168 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section (3)
for the words “ four years ” the words “ five years ” shall be substituted.

9. After zection 219 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely

“219A. The provisions of sections 128, 1404, 1544, 156 and 168,

Xyif‘?ilf] as amended by the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and

of  Municipal Councils (Third Amendment) Act, 2010, shall have effect

2010 notwithsianding anything inconsistent therewith contained in

Chapter VIII or in any other provisions of this Act, or in any
Jjudgment, decree or order of any court.”.

CHAPTER 11

AMENDMENTS TO THE BoMuay ProvinciaL MUNICIPaL
Corporations AcT, 1849

L]%)((Jm'f 10. After section 99C of the Bombay Provincial Municipal

o160, Corporations Act, 1949 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as
“the Provincial Corporations Act ™), the following section shall be
inserted, namely :\—

“99D. (1) Notwithstanding anythmg contained in section 99B
or 89C, the State Government may at any time, by notification
in the Official Gazette and for reasons to be specified . such
notificaton, revise the rates and extent of the Local Body Tax
determined under section 99B, or, as the case may be, undcr
section 99C.

{2) Every notification issued under sub-section (I) shall be laid,
as soon as may be, after it iz issued, bef'ore each IHouse of the
State Legislature.”.

11. In section 129 of the Provincial Corporations Act,—
(I) after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely \—

“Provided further LhaL the Corporation may dcétermine
different rates of properiy tax for dlﬁ(,rent categories of user of
a building or land or a part thereof:

(2) in the second proviso, for the WOIdS “Provided that” the
words “ Provided also that” shall be substituted.
12. In section 406 of the Provincial Corporations Act,—
(i) in sub-section (6),—
(a) for the words, figures and letter “ the demand notice in

L

Amendment
of section
168 of Bonw
11T of 1888.

Insertion of

zection 218A
in Bom. 131 of
1888,

Certain
provisions
to have
averriding
effect.

Insertion of
section 99D
in Bom. LIX
of 1949,

Power of
State
Government
to revisa
rates of
Local Body
Tax.

Amendment
of section

129 of Bom.
LIX of 1949.

Amendment
of section

406 of Bom.
LIX of 1949,

respect of levy of cess under Chapter XIA” the words, figures



g HETTE IITHS TS0 ARTART 91T 208, (EHY ve, 20%0/ITRTFT 949, T1dh §R32

and letters “ the demand notice in respect of levy of cess under
Chapter XIA or the Local Body Tax under Chapter XIB * shall be
substituted ; »,, .

(b) in clause {), after the words “ by the Cess Officer” the
words “ or any other offizer,, not bung Lh(\ Doputy Commissioner ”
shall be inserted ; .

(1) -after sub-section (7), the foilowing sub-section shall be added,
namely :—

“(8) No appeal under sub-section (6) shall be entertained by
the Deputy Commissioner or,-as the case may be, the
Comunissioner unless the amount of the disputed tax claimed
from the appe]la'nt has been deposited by the appellant with the
Commissioner. ’

Amendment 13, In Schedule ‘D’ of the Provm(,ml Corporations A(,L in (‘hdpter
of Sehedule VIIT,—

‘D’ to Bom. .
LIX of 1949. (A) in rule 7A,—

(1) in sub-rule (1},—

() after the words and figures “ the Bombay Stamp Act,
1958 the words “ as a base value, ” shall be inserted ;

(b) for the words “taking into consideration the market
value of such building or land, as a base value ; and also have
regard to the following factors, namely :—” the words “ taking
into consideration the market value of such building or land,
as a base value. The Commissioner, while fixing the capital
value as aforesaid, shall also have regard to the following
factors, namely :— shall be substituted ;

(2).1n sub-rule (2), for the words “ assigned to various such
categories ” the words “ assigned to various such factors and
categories ” shall be substituted ;

() in rule 21, in sub-rule (2}, for the words “ four ycars” the
words “ five years ” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER IV
AnENDMENTS To THE CITy oF NAGPUR CoRPoRATION AcT, 1948

Amendment 14, In section 115A of the City of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948
of section (hgreinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Nagpur Corporation

(1{ :}(;Aﬁifﬁ j1 Aet™), to sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

of 1950. “ Provided that, the Corporation may determine different rates of
property tax for different categories of users of a building or land
or a part thereof. ”.

Anmfﬂdm?llt 15. Inscection 119 of the Nagpur Corporation Act, in ¢lause (B),—
of soction _

119 of 6.7, . (1) in sub-clause (@),~—
and B;’-”g‘_'g (@) after the words and figures “ the Bombay Stamp Act, 1958
of 1950,

the wards “ as a base value, 7 shall be inserted




TETTE SITH T3 SATEROT {3775, SR 8¢, 2080/ SUTTAT 2, Wk 332

(b) for the words “ taking inte consideration the market value
of such building or land, as a base value ; and alse have regard
to the following factors, namely :— " the words “taking into
consideration the market value of such bailding or land, as a base
value, The Commissioner, while fixing the capital value as afore-
said, shall also have regard to the {ollowing facters, namely - —”
shall be substituted ; ' '

(2) in sub-clause (b}, for the words “assigned to various such
categories ” the words “assigned to various such factors and
categories ” shall be substituted. :

CHAPTERV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPLL COUNCILE, NAGAR
PancHAYATS aND INDUSTRIAL TowNsHIPs AcT, 1965,

16. In section 105 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panehayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter, in this
Chapter, referred to as * the Munieipal Councils Act ™, to sub-secticn
* (1), after the sencond proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, the Council may determine different rates
of tax for different categories of users of a building or land or a part
thereof. ™.

Mah.
XTI ol
1966.

17.
(3).—

} (1} in clause (@)~

{a) after the words and figures “ the Bombay Stamp Act, 1858 ”
the words “as a base value, ” shall be inserted ;

In section 114 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section

(b) for the words * taking into consideration the market value
of such building or land, as a base value ; and also have regard
to the following factors, namely :—" the words “taking into
F . consideration the market value of such building or land, as a
base value. The Chief Officer, while fixing the capital value as
aforesaid, shall also Have regard to the following factors,
namely :-— ” shall be substituted.

(2) in sub-<clause (&), for the words “ assigned to various such
categories * the words “assigned to various such factors and
categories " shall be substituted.

18. In section 124 of the Municipal Couneils Act, in sub-gection
(2), for the words “four years ” the words “five years ” shall be
substituted.

Amendment

of section .
105 of Mah. ]
XL of 1965, co

Amendment
of section
114 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendment
of seetion
124 of Mah.
X1 of 1965.



Power to
remove
difficulty.

Repeal of

Mah. Oud.
IX of 2010
and Mah.
Ord. X of

2010 and

saving.

HETS VTET T SETEIT W TE, TeHat ¢, Y0R0/3qgmuT v, 7F 8332
CHAPTER V1
MISCELLANEOL'S

19, (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Bombay Provincial
Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City of Nagpur Corporation Act,
1948 or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in respect of
the matters contained in this Act, the State Governnient may, as the
occasion arises, by order published in the Official Gazette, do anything
not inconsistent with the provisions of the Mumbal Municipal
Corporation Act, the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act,
1949, the City of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 or, as the case may
be, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Act, which appears
to it to be necessary for the purpose of removing the defficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be mude after the expiry of a
period of two years from the date of commencement of the respective
section of this Act.

(2} Every order made under sub-section (I) shall be laid, as soon as
may be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

20. (1) The Bombay Provincial Municipal Coerporations (Amend-
ment) Ordinance, 2010 and the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
and Municipal Counecils (Amendment) Ordinance, 2010, are hereby
repealed. - -

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
including any notification or order issued under the corresponding
provisions of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Bombay
Provineial Muhicipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City of Nagpur
Corporation Act, 1948 or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act,
1965, as amended by the sald Ordinances, shall be deemed to have
been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts, as amended by this Act.

Bom.
11 of
1888,

Boni.
LIX of
1949,

C.P
and
Berar
IT of
1950,

Mah.
XL of
1965.

Bem.
III of
1888,

Bom.
LIX of
1949.

CP
and
Berar
II of
1950.

Mah.

AL of
19656,

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT FPRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND FUBLISHED

BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 2:-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI
ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 2i-A,
NETAJ SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNTROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVL




