ag 3, 3w vl AR, UM RQ, RoR/ATIE R, ¥H 2R3I7 [y ¢, fFaer : vud ws.00

ST ThAie Q8
Eutsead cane
wERTE frarieam siftfaw o TeaaTEr wEna Fetet ARy T S TaTam.
HATHHTOTFRT
W qoke T WENTE U WATE R.—TER (OIS s simeran fafae IO
wifutas T AE qERT seaEdl A, L o e

TR X WIS Yo% TTT AT, TAEATT FHA! fGeie Henreg faerigeren Tée Afufzas sy, .
TS FHIVITE =T TR

€. W ueH,
TERTE ITTaA,
Taedt 7 =g Taam.

|A RoRo W1 WERTE ATUHER HHi® R
{ =1 TR At e ¢ RS e S
T % WS Ro%o TIST WUH WIEE dheieT SaHa. )
WENTE TTHed sivend e faafae wefieas weive srorsh
TERUN FToarEs! At
FITES HERTE SRS FUEOT O T oY, wnael, WRAR Turasare
TEEEE] T, AGN, B At womE a4 e —

YT T
RN
o () @ wufouE, WERTE SRETEE eER (B SQE0 T ENCn) @ am T

AYET, 2020 2 wUH. .

AT IR—8 5% (g)



3 TERTE FITA TS0 AR W =W, R 3%, RoRo/dWmE -, ¥IF R]3I7

(k) () o0 ¢ T & &, TATA & T U e SR
(@) M AT ST TEE WA el e A Sl ®E, I8
e 2 T Jo%0 UNGH AT I

UL {9
HE WER AR FW AEfEE, Rjue qrEl PR

T wRue A R HEE HIEN SR o S, 2u (IR AT, A ST, S Seeid
e ¢ TR o Y ST ST A ST $TE) HreAl e 3 o e
i &9 ((8) FeR, BIn die-theld FHISS UEr HEe —
3 = “(3%) W SIUFPErET qlaa S Ted, STERrEe e e et
ST oo A s S Ty auEeed 9 e S TR e sa
R ATTAE! T SRV A=A e ST savae Furea (fAEenids )
Td TR ARARRNG,—
(W) SR T SO GERTE Ougd R (Y FEE0 T guRom)
S, voto TTEAT YW FATRHE (NS, T7 Cie-somd, warel [l
o ga AT R WU AN SIY) TN SRl Y AT S
o o me fefHkE e S
(FF) SR = Awel S i SUTRIE IS SHe
TE-Fe () WY SreEl SNETE Y YRUEE See FHE qv, g
e 9 gF el EAEe e s
TENTE, TS0 wY BT SeeN 3% SR oA A AT
J9 3T A ST TR gEedr TS i e ARel gearar Jie
ferem B9 gE=T SN WR a9 He falae Sefea ST,
YN SR BT R e UEhIeEe EaaTel Y SHeTany & SEe ST

~

SR B HOR @ @t afubEerar wem ¥ = uE-wem () el —
st (F) (%), () Fm (@) ™ = wergRIasstt « (), (39), () foban () 7

o e B A ATEA HOAE TE
@ (@) (a0, (@) a1 (F) W wemder ¢ (@), (38) R (D)7 @

FEES < (95), (32), (3%) 2T (¥6) 7 & o aRgel VA Iee.
T Rque AW, HRR A8 H sihuHEmEren sey § e, —
ﬁﬁﬁ% (=) *ﬁzm (8) W “ (%), (%®) AT () mﬂwa”ﬂ (57,
T e (28), (%8) TeRar (¥F) " &7 He/ehd Srdel U e ;
@;ﬁ () T (837) T “ (3), (¥2) e, aunfiata (v8) ” ar wempast

“ (), (18), (1) Tman, maifiata, (%) 7 @ weipy @ HOAE A5



NERTE VAR IETT AT ST G, UM 3%, 20%0/3A0 R, T 2’32
(1) die-we (o) el —

(W) “ (%), (¥2) fmr, venfifs (23) 7 o Aipatast “ (38), (3), (%)
T, mudats, (39) 7 g1 USE §ieE v 39

(FF) @s (&7) 78, s-EE (UF) O, © (0%, (v3) W, genfefy,
(22) 7 1 oA ¢ (33, (39, (13) Toan, gaiedta, (3%) 7 @ Ao

W, TIRER 9FF & aaare s L6 T, TiE-whery (1) T @8 (&)

w1 - (F9) T, © Te-wem (5), (29) T, aaieta, de-wew (¢9) T
e . . ) _ ) .
FEEIE ¢ -t (), (22), (22) A, wenfete, me-skerm (U) 7 g1 '
IEA FIUAF T
B, HER FRA Y AEEATE gEA ST, —
() SHEeRTTEer < (2oh) 3 (22) 7 A7 TerEEst ¢ (9. (33) A (3F) 7
AeTRY ENEE FITITE 4T
() W UH WE, AR R R, [ AR S SREe w0 e -
€ 3. vrEETeR ToRET HIEEEE AT TieedT YA 3, Bl 3)
FHAOT TE TR st s =1 30-T (FR) 79 TR
. 5 N - . i
g ATERET AR T O FEET T8 SEOIFAT e
R A TR A (). AR T 28 92 ;

(M 9T FF T, “ T SRaT A aEdehiehdl AT AU 7 A
gAY “ fdhar areareet T HeRearaEt Weret S FHee ek Soe
A ATATHIS! AR AU T € WX THaeiel 7 81 Tofg THIEs hva

i

(=) 9T AR HE, €T oRET W ATedehishil aTead A0 7 A
AR FUGTHE SRR AME F W Wed quiEeet ¥ w Ao Aae s

HAT FE—R-42Y

BCERASCAR]



¥ TEWTE FITA TS0 SETERIT WOt ¥R, TWA 3%, RoRe/39Fg ], WH 1)]32
pETUEIE]
HERTE U1 a9, SR, AIEH § a1 qasia FT Aa9, 0%
It AR,
T ok W9, TERRE (00 SEEE, TR, SISO 9 Aeear dEiie w0 ST, (o
- . > -.E'TT
sty 2RY, Tl FEH s T, TEN EoiH WA HOAE A T
ESUETRE EE.
AT e
\93] IS
SN
TERTE “\oF, B ST AN FEe HAY W AR AR A ae 3o
et o oo _ . P
=i U TR, TEET, HeRT YeH e T AT, ooy W Hel WX AT gy <
Roo? WEAT  TIET TERIUTEAT HeWlel SYaal, 0T FONEE wIUAE Siee FEEien AR
Wiﬁ e geiEdlices TR AR Y w4 seRie WHEREH A
AT =R s N f . . . N
Taatea Yeh{ul AR
ARG SR IU
- WERTE TN Aaiadter & AT, eesle e FUwom.
W Rew W 6. TEATE TSI ARG S A, o (T TR, T URRYOT, T R ¢doe
T, - ot . - , . o
atiges USSR Y SEEPTT T STE A A 3TR) ATl et 3O GIEHOE 3 gy
FHER ¥R Hdler, TT () 9 (&) g, T WE SREe] Hw0Ui A c— 2.
T ?h?ﬁ'jﬁ[r N
3T - - b R £
qaro, © (30 TEARE GTATER USE NSRS HAE i3
AR Ufdfes, WeE A AT e
THY TUIET ST AU . _
() Eeeie Wova Jora THIR FaEiiel ST ST
T WS, W A AeE S T 39T TG
YA S W WO IR TORT EE ¥ TR,
W orecw W . UHEH W AWMU Ferm 23 Ga¥, e den e S
TR aa
amf‘m"_ ?T&'T‘:T .
FUE 0
] EI;WT{
R HEEE
hHIT,
FERTZ “ooar. & afufTes i mvEldl quR OIS el AR AT aegRiE Geok
e oo BTy - s . e =T HET.
Ve, T YRR RIS, HETO WRGETEA T SIS, ReeR W SRARIGE FAN o
ot W gyead ielod] HENMET GUES] SHET el ATETER fae gE &l
AEEE F TR HTETER R e SRR S9 Sel Sel e W0l
e ATOHHIE T S GUER W1, @ HANATN S 9 ol SRR

EZLUIN




HEWTE A 0T SERINUT WFT 91, T 9%, J0%o/39TRT %, 3F 8337 4

ThI0T W=

HENTEZ eaies &Y AE, 003 Are GuRUT

Rook, 0. TERTY ToAamE T SMET, 300 (AId ANE, A7 WERUTE, SATET FEY TR koot =
= IP"ITTV
e “Temarad Y stiEy Y o uarT el TR AT oAl te U TE-hetd st
. FHEH §
(?) wed, We () T, e T8 WK TE AT ddie e
is HT
“(F) SRI=N WU STl g5eT Seie], R HHE

(S SoFe WA IR 98 e, .

. HENIY TEIE Y AT e vo o] Ul e (%) WEl, e g4 Reoh,
. . ! NP ~ HENTE
(@) 77, “ AUed= 7 W HEEAESl < HerEE] 7§ A 2 SO TEd. shEen
FUfER T
EEH
BASERIN
8. it AT A ST e I3 W WE-EeT (') Wﬁ,— e
TR
() g3 (F) 5, < FHIAAE] AT [hEl syl EdE e Ay el R
T FHOAR] FEAE] T YA 7 T AR GE FT | C g o o

S Welenl 3E, Fhel @A A el g shern e el fmes A
TR W A ST 7 9T TR i e, e wee
ANEA  hIUANE Toel
“qr stefFaIsTEaE FOTHE G BT STHaHT, (9 T SEe
SRIVTEHE] FAAENIA 18 7 Al Tehea TGar 7 HEd, ST FeaHTe

{haT ST T, BT AR el SRy e g A8
fehan g=ae STleeh STECITET Tl Shell STeATS [ATed sasT=ara A aEd
A 7

(@) @ (F) =0 QgHEa, Teld WRE HEg] rge shIuan
qEe —

“ AEHA -~ e Herre SR, ¢ fafed wiaed 7,
TR 7, 33 IR © F < IO Wi T e a1, e, T
Teifeld, s to I FAgEs Fefer TNt T e e s




T ool =

TR
e
Enti

qE e
%% =
TETTOM,

T ool =

TENTY ¥R TS0 SETER0T 90T 1, Ui 2%, 30%0/39ITF |, 7 ]33

3. TOTAI &Y STl e 98 Tl —

o

() ke (8) W, “¥R T0 7 AT HRRIEST “ T R 69 7 A

(@) die-sem (o) T, “UF 7R T 7 41 HegGas] © 0 g $u 7
T TSR STAE U dSeT

(M) TE-FeT (22) B, “ U gEHaT 7 O TSNS “ 2N FHAA @l
T RTEE A0 5.

Y. HEEEE R ST wem w3 wdien, deemer (3) 99, qee

TE - WA FIA g6t AT % UfURT Yoto W WHTETE SIUAH AT

FEE WETEE GEe —

“(FE) T TIEH, TIeHE TEE Teed ASgEegE, -

() =7 viie, e e s B e 9 Seem s

Shiy AT E 3TEET A WA ey el Wi BaiEtyg sty

] FATVRET TR G A A A S 79 AR sy
U AR A A I

(/@) a1 FutEEET IR ARTeS O s s S
AFIAEIEE] WOl (77 Al Werr EETEe s Ghen s
FIR] TR S FARTOE S S el (ehine
STIHIRATEN T ¥ o we

Y. HEEEiRT S A w1 e, Sede () 56, B T

T GvEe ST deel i —

&, TEEGT Y TMOHreAT e a2 T, Te-wen (2) we—

(U =g (F) 9%, “ TEIF A0 FHEET AF 97 FeEgInE © 9 7
() T (@) 0, Be g gfas s 45w —

“(M) = snatEEEy e, e, gue T afafem, 1ju] st
AT AU WICHTEAT=T STl s e TEElel sena e

1qu2
il
EH]

X



AERTE WTHT TAGH AFLUR W 9, TS 2%, 0%0/A00F §, 79 ¢'32 9

Yo,  UETERE W UM FOm cu W, de-wem () T — T ool
TR
(2) BT (@-3) W, W©F T wHiEe G I - Gl i
“(-3) A AT B TR SR 8 S G
ATHEH FoTH 3o T Te-wmerd (R) TRar (%) orsd feen Ry, TR
TR

(W-y) o9 83 =7 U-Ferd (9) 373 30a ool e, fper 7
(7)) HE () 9w, @©E @ gae sy 35l —

“(8-2) TEE 34 A U (2) offr (3) vy Fwon oy, fRar v

¢. TEISGT SR EETAT hel (& w7 GE-me (¥) THIE WS (@) 9w seen o
- - o . - . - n HETTE
* THT G SO SN T G Uar 97 TR iies ¢ TR G ST e

YA A", T A ARON THOME wHih Y 8 U Grge Sud 5. FATE S

ok
oy,
W TEHAEA FT A S ST F weE — e vean o
R
() Hig ¢ meleT 395 () W ¢ SIS e U A Nagee < S e S
s
T AET GEMER $IUgE A ; T
HEH T
() =R AR ub o, STAR () AW A4 wmEE ST Uiet o apor o TR
FYN WehT, el SFrTes Taredl 39-A1% (%) Ao, Jele ST ST SRS HaTd
e 1 —
(@) FR T %
(M) FEEEE 4T forep o 7
(3) 9T u& T, T AR SE arEe S e
“ug @l () i G
SLE W WA TRl WEEE H R k5 o= A
Wl AR, TOK FIE A wE i

Ro.  HOASTEA W IURIAR Fgeear STEE W W, 91 % T W (3) 59 weol W
. . e - . qENT
e, FER T 7 A WGUAST IR, FEE AP 7 OB 4egT anEd F i

T kg
AT

2R

RSEIES AL N



<
T vool,
TR
EREE ]
FHE S
A
g 7oA
FHTTOT,

AENTE VITE T SHTEROT Wi A1, e 3%, RoRo/49IRd |, ¥ IR

R GeTEtg o RfufAmmen Secear stEEl T e, —
(%) ieTEERst, « % ” A1 FeHTmeR “ R W% T B AEGR S I
T A ;
(3) T 30, T () Wei, “ U1 7 1 HOFLUTS « P! TE g Ut ”
g1 T FEH RV 45 ;

(3) W' w¥, &9 (3) W=, “wwEn (Fwg) 7 § IR qean a4
(%) A W TIETER T ;
(v) gty FR, gEe Hir e e s age —

“ gy St R WR HEER TER e W% .

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIGN, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED
BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJL
SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 0604 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE GF GOVERNMENT
PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAL 400 004,
EDITCR : SHR] PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVL



AT HET AY

2, A2 | A, S ¥, 020/3S ¥, T 1IN [ 72 2, Foma - &0 900

HHIRUT HHIH 2
PUEE
RRTY frarHear afufa 1 Tyt S Ao o e i

T

HERTE PR TIFTA, STHTER A0 9, foi 3% et Rote 76, go w1 d e
T FUATT AT, HERTE FIaE Fae (4 96iau F GaRem) e, oo
{TT o0 = HENTRY ST WIS 12) T, IS hHTH 3 O, — .

() W HE Qwed,  (23) AT Yt ¢ (1) I awE
(?) e T 2R 7e, et et (v3)  avtast (1) 7 A ae.

()

AT 2R

RN BELALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIGNERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY
SHRL PARSHITRAM JAGANNATH GUSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21.A, NETAJ SUBHASH
BOAD, CHARNT ROAD, MITMBAT 400 04 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTRNG,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION 21.A, NETAJT SI'BHASH ROAD. CHARNI ROAT, MITMBAT 400 64
EDITOR | SHR! PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVT.




mbo, w0 ] T, TEIRY, RoroAmIE S, WHRAR [ T, P o 1200

HGTIRIOT FHHISH 3@

oTiRreRa FeRTeT
meRTy faurmear sfafraw o gt wenfuer SO wEmRw 7 e T
aufor faelt T = fgwrmems e fadad (Fusit wEEE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy and Amendment! Act, 2010
{Mah. Act No. XII of 2010), is hercby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashira,

H. B. PATEL,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XII OF 2010

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 29th April 2010,

An Act further to amend certain tax laws in operation in
the State of Maharashtra.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend certain tax laws in
operaticn in the State of Maharashtra, for the purposes hereinafior
appearing ; it is hereby cnacted in the Sixty-first Year of the Repuhlic
of India as follows :—

CHAPTER1
PRELIMINARY
1, (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Tax Laws {Levy Short title
and Amendment) Act, 2010. und

(2) (@) Sections 1 to 6 shall come into force on the date of fgﬂ’?me

publication of this Actl in the Official Gazette,

(b) Save as otherwise previded in this Act, the remaining sections
shall ceme into force with effect from the 1st May 2010.

YT IS Biy-g (V)



Amendment
of section 3

HEITR, T T JTART 9T S8, TR 27, R0%0/39TE §, 1 937

CHAPTER 11

AMENDMENTS TO THE BomBay MoTor VEHcLES Tax Act, 1958.

2. In section 3 of the Bombay Motor Vehicles Tax Act, 1958

of Bom. LXv (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Motor Vehicles Tax
of 1838. Act ™}, after sub-section (1K), the following sub-section shall be inserted,

Amendment
of section 4
of Bom.
LXV of
1938.

Amendment
of section 9
of Bom.
LXV of
1DE8.

namely —

¢ (1F) SBubject to the provisions of this Act, there shall be levied
and collected on all motor vehicles (including trieycles) plying for
hire or reward, fitted with fare meters and used or kept for use in
the State for the carriage of not more than six passengers, a one
time tax for the life time of such vehicles,—

(£} if registered after the date of commencement of the

Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy and Amendment) Aet, 2010

- (hereinafter, in this sub-section, referred to as * the said date ),
at the rates specified in Part I of the Second Schedule ;

(if) if already registered before the said date and on which tax
is already paid under sub-section (1), at the rates specified in
Part IT of the Second Schedule :

(Zii) if first registered in any other State and thereafter on
transfer thereof in the State of Maharashtra, a new registration
mark is assigned to the same afier the said date, then having
regard to the month of the first registration in the other State,
at the rates specified in Part I of the Second Schedule. ”.

3. In section 4 of the Motor Vehicles Tax Act, in sub-section (2)—

(a) for the brackets, figures, letters and word “ (1C), (ZD) or
(IE) ” the brackets, figures, letters and word “ (IC), (1D), (1E) or
(1F) " shall be substituted :

(b) in clauses (a), () and (¢}, for the brackets, figures, letters and
word “(IC), (1D) and (1E} " the brackets, figures, letters and word
“(10), (ID), (JE) and (IF) ” shall be substituted.

4. In section 9 of the Motor Vehicles Tax Act,—

(@) in sub-section (), for the brackets, figures, letters and word
“(IC}, (1D} or (1E) " the brackets, figures, letters and word “ (I¢y,
(1D}, (1E) or (1F) " shall be substituted ;

(b} in sub-section (6A), for the brackets, figires, letters and word
“{1C), (1D} or (IE) ” the brackets, figures, letters and word “ (10),
(ID), (1E) or (1F}” shall be substituted ;

Bom.
LXV

1958,

Mak.
RIl of
2010,



HERTS, TTHT V0 HATIRUT SR 3158, THET 2%, 080 /39T <, ¥ 4337

{e) in sub-section {7}, —

(£} for the brackets, figures, letters and words “ (IC), (1D} or,
as the case may be, {IE) " the hrackets, figures, letters and words
“{ICY, (1D}, (1K) or, as the case may be, (1F) " ghall be substituted ;

{if} in clause (a), in sub-clausc ({}, for the brackets, figures,

] letters and words “ (IC), {1D} or, as the case may be, (1K) ” the

— brackets, figures, letiers and words “ (1C), (1), (1K) or, as the
case may be, (1F) 7 shall be substituted.

5. In section 16 of the Motor Vehicles Tax Act, in sub-section {I),
in clasue (¢}, in sub-clause {iif), for the words, brackets, figures and
e letters “ sub-section (IC) or, sub-section (1D) or as the case may be,
sub-section (1K)} ” the following shall be substituted, namely . —
“ gub-section {JC), (1D}, (1K} or, as the case may be, sub-section
(1F) ™.
6. I[n the SECOND SCHEDULE appended to the Motor Vehicles
Tax Act,—

(@) in the heading, {or brackets, figures, letters and word “ (1C]
and (/E} " the brackets, figures, letters and word * (IC), (IE) and
(1F) ” shall be substituied ;

(6) in PART 1, after entry 2, the following entry shall be added,

namely -~
“ 3. Motor vehicles (including 11 times the annual
tricycles) plying for hire rate of Lax payvable for
J— or reward, fitted with the relevant class of
fare meters and used the vehicles mentioned
for carriage of not in sub-clause IV of
moere than six clause A under the
passengers. FIRST SCHEDULE, 7,

(¢} in PART II, after the words “ goods or materiais * the words
“ or for carriage of not more than six passengers for hire or reward
and fitted with fare meter ” shall be inserted ;

{d) in PART 1II, after the words “ goods ar materials ” the words
“ or for carrtage of not more than six passengers for hire or reward

and fitted with fare meter ” shall be inserted.

TR S0F—F'9-3-3

Amendment,
of section 16
of Bom., LXV
of 1958

Amendment
to SECOND
SCHEDULE
of Bom. LXV
of 14938



Insertion of
seetion TA in
Mah. XVT of

1975.

Application of
provisions of
section 22 of
Maharashtra
Value Added
Tax Aect, 2002

and certain
provisions of

rules made

thereunder.

Amendment
of section 3
of Mah. X1

of 1887.

Insertion of
section 12A
in Mah. X1.1

of 1987

Application of
certain
provisions of
rules made
under
Maharashtra
Value Added
Tax Act, 2002,

FERTE WTH TSI SR W H1S, Ciet 3%, Yo%o/A9ma §, ¥ 983

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE MaHARASHITRA STATE TAX 0X PROFESSIONS,
TraDES, CALLINGS AND EMPLOYMENTS ACT, 1975.

7. After scction 7 of the Maharashtra State Tax on Professions,
Trades, Callings and Employments Act, 1975, the following section
shall be inserted, namely :—

“TA. Subject to the provisions of this Act and the rules made
thereunder in this behalf, the provisions related to audit under section
22 of the Maharashtira Value Added Tax Act, 2002 and the provisions
of the rules made thereunder, so far as they relate to the clectronic
filing of returns and electronic payment of tax, or any amount payable
under this Act, shall mutatis mutandis apply for the purposes of this
Act.”.

CHAPTERIV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MaHarASHTRA Tax ox LUXURIES ACT, 1987.

8. Ip secticn 3 of the Maharashtra Tax on Luxuries Act, 1987
(hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Luxuries Tax Act ),
in sub-section (2), for clauses (a) and (b), the following clauses shall be
substituted, namely :—

“ {a) Whoere the charge for luxury Nil.
provided in a hotel is not

exceeding rupees seven hundred

and fifty per day, per residential

accommodation.

{6} Where the charge for luxury
provided in a hotel exceeds
rupees seven hundred
and fifty but does not
exceed rupees twelve hundred
per day, per residential
accommodation.

4 per centum
of such turnover
of receipts.”,

9. After section 12 of the Luxuries Tax Act, the following section
shall be inserted, namely —

“ 12A. Subject to the provisions of this Acet snd the rules made
thereunder in this behalf, the provisions of the rules made under the
provisions of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002, so far as
they relate to the electronic filing of returns or electronic payment of
tax or any amount payable under this Act, shall mutatis mutandis
apply for the purposes of this Act. "

Mak.
XVI

18975,

Mah.
JX of
2003,

Mah.
XLl
of

1987

Mah.
X of
2005,



HERTE, T AU ST |1 378, TR %, R0%0 /3T R, 7idh 2337
CHAPTER V
AvENDMENTS To 'THE ManarasuTra VarUue Anpenp Tax Act, 2002.

Mah. 10. In scetion 18 of the Maharashtra Value Added ‘Tax Act, 2002
;;(ggf (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Value Added Tax
 Act ™), in sub-section (1}, after clause (f), the following clauses shall be

added, namely -—
“(g) undertakes any change in the nature of buisness, or
(h) effects any changes in the Bank account,”.

11. In section 20 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (4), in
clause (h), for the word “ after ” the word “ before ” shall be substituted.

12, In section 23 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section 10y, —

(e} in clause (g}, for the portion beginning with the words
“ During the.course ” and ending with the words “ to be evaded 7 the
following portion shall be substituted, namely (—

“ During the course of any proceedings under this Act, if the
prescribed authority is satisfied that the tax has been evaded or
sought to be evaded or the tax Hability has not been disclosed
correctly or cxcess sel-off has been claimed by any dealer or
person "

(0) in clause (d), after the provise, the follewing Explanation
shall be added, namely :—

“ Explanution.—For the purposes of this sub-section, “ preseribed
authority ”, “the said authority ”, “such authority ” and “ any
authority ” shall mean the Commissioner or, as the case may be,
the autheritics appointed under section 10 and other officers or
persens to whom the Commissioner has delegated his powers in
this behalf'”,

13. In section 29 of the Value Added Tax Act,—-

{a) in sub-section (6), for the words “ one hundred rupees ” the
words “ one thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

(&) in sub-section (7), for the words “ one thousand rupees ” the
words “ five thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

{c) In sub-seclion (17), for the words “five yearz ” the words
“eight yvears ” shall be substituted.

Amendmernt
of section
18 of Mah.
IX of 2008,

Amerament
of geciics
20 of dak,

(X oof 2005,

Amendmen:
of  section
23 of Mah.
IX of 2005

Amendrment
of section
28 o Mah,
[X of 2005,



g HERY WIAT TACH AT T 05, THE R, R0%0/I9RA ], Tk 1’5R

Am;‘“-dm_?m 14. In section 42 of the Value Added Tax Act, after sub-section (3},
;2 Osfci;,ff the following sub-section shall be inserted and shall be decmed Lo
IX of 2005. have been inserted with effect from the 1st April 2010,

namely —

“{34) The State Government may, by notification published in
the Official Gazette, —

{a) provide a scheme of composition for the registered dealers
who undertake the construction of flats, dwellings or buildings or
premises and transfer them in pursuance of an agreement along
with the land or interest underiving the land ;

{h) prescribe the rate of tux by way of composition, in lieu of

the amount of tax payvable on the transfer of goods (whether as
goods or in seme other form), in the execution of such works
contracts by such registered dealer under this Aet. ™.

Amendment 15. In section 31 of the Valoe Added Tax Act, io sub-scction (17,
of spetion
51 of Mah.
IX of 2005. “Provided that, the Commissioner may, subject to such
conditions and restrictions as may be prescribed, reduce the refund

and grant only part of the refund clainied in such application. 7.

the fellowing provise shall be added, namely :—-

Amendment g, In section 61 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-
of section i .
61 of Man. Section t1},—
;L = . .
IX of 2005. {1} in clause {a), for the words “ exceed or exceeds rupces forty
fakh 7 the words “ exeeeds rupees sixty lakh ” shall be substituted ;
{(2) after elause (b}, the following clausce shall be inserted,
namely - :
“(¢} if he holds an Entitlement Certificate in respect of any
Package Scheme of incentives, granted under this Act or, as the
case may be, under the Bombay Sales Tax Act, 1959,".

Amendment 17. In sccticn 85 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (2),—
of section. 85 ) . . . }
of Mah. IX (1} after clause (6.2}, the following clauses shall be inserted,

Of 2003, namciy —

“(6-3) an order passed under sub-section (2) or (4} of section 30
regarding the interest payable by the dealer under any provision
of this Act, or

{6-4) an intimation issued under sub-section (7) of section 683,

1

or”;
(£} after clause (), the following clause shall be inseried, namely -
“id 1Y the order passed undoer sub-sections (1) and (£} of section

35, or"

Bom.
,

el ol
039,



HEWTE YR TSI HARIHT HIT #HTS, ufeT 3R, R0%0/39ME §, TH 2R

18. In scction 86 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-gection (2}, 1n
clause (), for the words “as well as the name and address of the
purchasing dealer ” the words “ as well as the name, address and the
registration certificate number of the purchasing dealer” shall be
substituted.

19. In SCHEDULE A appended to the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in entry 4, in sub-entry (¢, after the word “pulses,” the
words “ sarki pend.” shall be inserted :

(2) the existing entry 55 shall be re-numbered as sub-entry {al
thereof; and after sub-entry (¢) as so re-numbered, the following
sub-entries shall be added, namely (—

“{by Camphor Nil %
{¢) Dhoop including Loban Nil %7
(3) after entry 56, the following entries shall be added, namely :—
“ 57 Katha {catechu} Nil %
58 Handmade Laundry Soap manufactured Nil % 7
by units certified by the Maharashtra
State Khadi and Village Indusiries Board

X%‘;m-f constituted under the Bombay Khadi and

4]

1960. Village Industries Act, 1960, but excluding
detergent.

90. In SCHEDULE B appended to the Value Added Tax Act, in
entry 4, in column (2), for the words “ Imitation Jwellery ” the words

“Hairpins, Imitation Jwellery " shall be substituted.

2i. In SCHEDULE C appended to the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in the heading, after the figure and sign “4% " the word,
figure and sign “or 5% " shall be added ;

(#) in entry 30, in column (2), for the words “oil cakes” the

words “oil cakes oxcluding sarki pend” shall be substituted ;

)

Amendment
of wociion 86
of Mah. IX
of 20056,

Amendment
w0 3CHEDULE
Aof Man. IX
of 2005

Arcendment
1t SCHEDULE
B of Mah IX
of 2005,

Amendment
1w SCHEDULE
¢ of Mak. IX
of 2005.



¢ TERTE S TR SQTHOT W 375, THRT IR, J0%0/AFE ?, Tk 2%3%

(3) in entry 44, in column (2), the words and brackets “katha
{catechu},” shall be deleted;

{4) entry 51 shall be deleted ;
{5) afier entry 114, the following entry shall be added, namely :—

“ 115 Vehicles operated on Battery or 5%".
Solar power.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION BRINTED AND PUBLISHED HY SHRE PARSHURAM SAGANNATH GOSAVI
DRINTED AT CGOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 214, NETAS SUBHAR  RUAD, CHARNL ROAD. MUMBAL 400 104 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION. 1.4, NETAI SURHASH ROAD. CHARN! ROAD, MUMBAL 406 004
EDITOR  SHRI PARNSHURAM JAUANNATH GOSAVL



