a¥ 3, 3w 3] WHAW, Tier qR, R0%0/AFA IR, TH 2R3 [U 3, B ¢ w9 ve.00

STHTEROT AT %
g SRt
wErTe g sfufee @ Teumt wenfua Fee searRy T e fatwm,
SIFHHUTERT
W?O?OWWWWR—WWW Ruce IR AV GUROT gy
FUgTHAr bR 3-3

feiw & TheT Q020 T AT, TR WA feten wenT fawmHTerr wEw sfuftEm wifgdee,
IER, WEE WO ¥ IR,
¥ 9. T,
. afE,
TERTE IR,
o 7 == foum,

T RoRo WT HERTE ATUFIH HHIF W
(1. gl @l ST ¢ WERTE WER e fEtw 23 et oo T
wa wiag Feten afufam.)

Ha§ WEiw AMUGTEH, fRue M AT GURUT wvarEiEr st
wue AT, I Amqe feedr weiSHR AT, O9E gEie sl ]ue I
“f FURET GUROT S0 §€ &8 ; wqrerefl, wrelg norrsarean were o, 9nR,

gEterRTeT Hiufaw wRoa I AR -

. I RiutHoww, qu¥ mHEie (QUROM) fufmd, wok 3@ mumE. W .

Wue 3. Heg e afufam, jue (WWE%W%%W“E@&%W” T &g =

mw ] . . afufraw
to, ITHT FUAT ST ) TS HOH & HelioA TS © T8 A 7 Al ::mam
TOGATA « TR THAGT ¥ T AR RIS FOAT A, s & o

TR,
W R—R -~



R HERTE TG TR FETERTT HOT SN, A {3, Rog0/ 3R, TF VR

g:;ﬁ‘«ém 3. g@aﬁmwzoaw,ﬁawmm

Ui &0 aéﬁﬁ -

q T HAR

0% TAIaE

.

SO « gom, W o T HEE FMT e o, SRS ufH,

TR gquR S WO RN TSRS R cATeAT TR SRS eI

i R me,wmmmmﬁwmﬁm

. e v Sl S R TreverEiE 3 el o hivTedtel
mwmmmmmwm,@w
JER e Tv STRNER AT SEERIER AT A5 ST G
Uoraier qEIewETl JoiRT FeT —

TSR /BT ST .covevrerrenneenes L o =
£33 A TR TEiE o UG/ SRR/ AEReE
*mﬁq‘ qﬁ-qm/'sq' aﬁq—m-p:, .......... s / Tu W

mm‘ra'&r g 4% TUA .

* ] A @reE. 7.7,

TR F, g@aﬁaﬁmmxcnﬁm,@g(z)nﬁﬂqﬁmﬁﬂ“ﬁﬁw
we ¥¢ ¥ gREeT HUA A5 —
FEROT,
ST THEETET e A% G, AT SHERYiN S heard
q7 HRUTEET 3T FIR AIGuind 1E fToEmER @ Sudn e, IR
eultgr g foekarear Rfewrge & asteT A ST R deel .

2RUR
TR



HERTE, PR V0 FQERIT WRT 9F, THI 27, 200/ R, T RIR 3

W, e AuFEE Aedcl SE U T, STEEr 3837 T, TS w wuc wm

(a7) = ufeEdE (R) W, et s
R o TTET
(F) Hig (37) weliet, W 3 A, © W T T 7 A AR, s v

“ TETS TUH @ UeTH QIEel wuaE 95T .

(@) 7g (=) wiie, @W R e, “Us g9 OrEw U7 9
TS, “ T 91X G9! B3 7 g1 ATl NI HIUA A

(m) =g (@) qefer, @ R wfen, ¢ @9 FER 7 97 AegRnEst,
“ g AR TGN 7 T TEHT SIEE AR G456l

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNKATH GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAT 400 004
AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD,
CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAL 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAV].



ag 2, AR WEEAR, Tl 7R, jove/Aw ?Q,‘ﬂ%z‘za? [y 2, Firt 1 B 2300

AW H7TEH Y
mEnTe furdzers sl g HEAET T Herer Tafran
snfoy faft 7 = Prummesa sreen fadad (e svraTe).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following

translation in English of the Bombay Stamp (Amendment) Act, 2009 (Mah. Act No. V of
2010), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

H. B. PATEL,
Secretary te Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. V OF 2010.
! First published, after having received the assent of the Governor, in the “ Maharashtra

Government Gazelte ¥, on the 12th April 2010].

An Act further to amend the Bombay Stamp Act, 1558

Bom.  WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Bombay Stamp
L{;‘w‘éf Act, 1958, fir the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted
“?% in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic of India as foliows .—

1. This Act may be called the Bombay Stamp (Amendment) Act, 2009, Short title.
Bom. 2. Insection 6 of the Bombay Stamp Act, 1958 (hereinafter referred Amendment

' : el s : . » of section 6
LX of {0 as “the principal Act”), in the proviso, for the words * ten rapees” . 570
1958, of Bom. LX

the words “ one hundred rupees ” shall be substituted. of 1958,

ST $3-~3% -2 (%}



C WEWTS WIEA TRAUST SMTHRUT $0T 3008, TS ¢3, Ro%o/ T 33, Wb 933

1“5’5,":1‘;0‘;0"({‘ 3. After section 10B of the principal Act, the following section shall
secli .
in Bom. LX be inserted, namely -—

of 1958.

Thuties to be “10C. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 10, in case
Ur"‘;;d éﬁéﬂl of the notary appointed under the Notaries Act, 1952, for the whole
draft or by or any part of the State of Maharashtra, the duty payable for
pay 0;‘3}*:; ::;Y performing the functions entrusted to him under any law for the
. time being in force, may be paid by him by way of cash, or by

demand draft or by pay order, in any Government Treasury or Sub-

Treasury or General Stamp Office, Mumbai and the notary shall

make an endorsement on the instrument as foliows, namely :—

Stamp Duty of Rs. ............. paid* in cash/by demand draft/by
pay order, vide * Receipt/Challan No. .......ccccceinnn, , dated the
..................... , in ¥ Government Treasury/Sub-Treasury Office at
................... fthe General Stamp Office, Mumbai.

Seal of the notary. Signature of the notary with date.
*Strike cut whatever is not applicable. .

Amendment 4, In section 48 of the principal Act, in clause (1), in the proviso,
L;_gfoiegt:;:f after the words “the date of the Instrument ”, the following portion
L.X of 1958. shall be added, namely :—

“ or where such agreement is cancelled by a registered cancellation
deed on the grounds of, dispute regarding the premises concerned,
inadequate finance, financial dispute in terms of agreed consideration,
or afterwards found to be illegal construction or suppression of any

other material fact, the application may be made within two yvears
from the date of such registered cancellation deed .

Amendment 5 15 SCHEDULE I appended to the principal Act, in article 36A,
of Schedule |

1 of Bor, i1 clause (a), in paragraph (I},
L.X of 1958, . . _ ,
() in entry (A}, in column 2, for the words “ Seven hundred fifty

rupees ” the words “ Six hundred rupees ” shall be substituted :

{6) in entry (B), in column 2, for the words “ One thousand five
hundred rupees ” the words “ One thousand two hundred rupees”
shall be substituted ;

(¢} in entry (C), in column 2, for the words “ Three thousand
rupees ” the words “ Two thousand rupees ” shall be substituted.

533 of

1952

0N BEHALF OF GOVERNAENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRENTEL AND J;iilil ASHED BY SHEL PARSHTURAM JAGANNATH
108SAVL, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ SULKHASH ROAL, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAT 400 (04 AN PURLISIIE!Y AT
DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUSLICATION, v1-A. NETAJ SUBHASH ROAD, CHARN ROAL, MUMBAT 400 004

EDTTOR SHRE PATRSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVE



