79T, 3. 3§ TARE . THUS/THAR/ATSHE-RR]/008-0¢

HDE TR E
[HAR, ATEIET R, Ro0\0/ATFRaT ], 71d 2]

TWHEA THAT WA HI5T FHIUATHIG AT WETST AT Y63 HHIE Gt e,

HOAT =AY
e frarrize afufm a Turei aEfia Fae ARy T Fee fafram.

STHAITHT

WA Qo009 W WEWTE Afafaw HWiH 9.— RRER uiFr diear, w3, merte TS
T 1] AT QT SOTE! GUROT FRUA afufay . .. RERRwo

feieR 1] WA o0l TS AT Wﬁﬁrm%ﬁwmmﬁmﬁﬂ Ffafrm miedrad,
TR, WE FoAd A AR,

. A e,
g,
TERT 3G,
o 7 =g fayo.

FH 009 AT WIRTE AfaF@w HA® Q0.
(|1, Tegaete WA ey ¢ WERTE WA e fis ¢ sitetEr Joo0t
AT oo g Feten aifufra.)
HieTaRt wimar wfE, 203, HERTE T 1] HIATT @ AT
AR FUgrEEt Afafaa
oy TATNEN, I TG AT TSI, BISERY Wikt |iEd, 2R3, TERTE TS
TR AT T, T STOTE GERT ) R SR ; e, SR TORTRITAT ST
Ft, IR Qe aifufam awvae 39 o —
%

(R) = SrufrEmmE, WISER wiHaT Wi (TR guron) sfufEm, 00w W dhiw T @
TRUTTa.

Y.
(RER)
T IR~ [fae : 3Ud <.00]



go HERTE THT I, TETHRT, AFIET ¢, 300\9/ATMRGT Q, I 2’1 [T =Y

() T, T U6, AATARIR 31 agemgR, Fad wier o1 feismg suerra 3ge.
T ey w1 R SRR UiEwAT diedn, 2R3, HERTY TSI SN ShedF[l, el Hold Ry

AT 3¢ e, — 2
i R
Wi‘? (F) Tie-FHAT () T, ARG ST 6T &9IR T9d 7 AT ety

quror. SR SRA A EIR T T 8 TSR S S0 95

(@) die-Fe (3) AL, © AT ST 9T §9IR B9 7 A7 TSt
“ S ST 38T IR 9F 7 BT HOTHR TSl 0T A

ITEH G JATE qRUTAY, TeE



3T, . &L HFAEE 4. THTH/THA/ATHA-3R]/R00E-0¢

WA, @RS R, Roow/anfsaa ], I ]R
HIAT 3ATS

TERTE faarrEe sifufrae @ TsawET weEfae Ferer R 7 had faftan
anfur fafy a1 = faurmseT el fadas (T H9aR).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Code of Cirminal Procedure (Maharashtra Amendment)
Act, 2007 (Mah. Act No. XXVII of 2007), is hereby published under the authority of

the Governor.
By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

A. M. SHINDEKAR,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXVII of 2007.

(First published, after having reccived the assent of the President, in
the “ Maharashtra Government Gazette” on the 1st October 2007).

An Act further to amend the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973,
in its application to the State of Maharashtra.

2of  WHEREAS it is expedient f{urther to amend the Code of

1974 Criminal Procedure, 1973, in its application to the State of
Maharashtra ; it is hereby enacted in the Fifty-eighth Year of the
Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act ﬁlay be called the Code of Criminal Procedure Shorttitle
(Maharashtra Amendment) Act. 2007. and

comnience-
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State ™"
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.
(% 2%)

gT 3207 [fpua : =77 <.00]



¥ %0 HERTZ WITHA TIATH, SATIRT, AT ¢, J0019/30HaT R, T1& §R3% [ e

Amendment 2. In section 29 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, in 2of

"f**‘f’“{i‘:“ffi. its application to the State of Maharashtra,— 1974.
I ACL £ 0
1974. (a) in sub-section (2), for the words “ten thousand rupees”

the words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (3), for the words “five thousand rupees”
the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

R Rt e R R AL CH



